
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
D Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)
D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler- District 14

Amount: $2400.00 Date: 4/28/2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Neighborhood Development Fund will be directed to Metro Parks for the rehabilitation of four (4)
baseball fields at Sun Valley Park. The funding will be used to purchase the materials and labor
cost.

City Agency: Metro Parks

Contact Person: Joshua Steele

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3809

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.

Z^L I l^A (JA. ^H(jA. JW/)/). ^
'istrict # Council Member Signature Amount Dalte
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Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Metro Parks

l Program/Project Name: Sun Valley Ballfield Rehabilitation

Yes/No/NA

_<7^_Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the |
request form description? i

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching |
fund amount? I

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
I the request form description? |

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building |
] or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ^A
i Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
I not, the funding source is probably NDF. |

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? j

[ Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for |
the fiscal year $25,000 or less? [

Prepared by: Date:

/LJ>

Effective October 2013



Southwest Baseball Inc.

6614AshbyLane
Louisville, Kentucky 40272

INVOICE FOR DONATED SERVICES & GOODS

Who Donated:

Description:

Field 1: Grove and cut with drag Add 30 bags of product

Field 2: Grove and cut infieldAdd 50 bags of product

Field 3: Grove and cut infield add 30 bags of product

Field 4: Grove and cut infield add 50 bags of product

Note: *Also field 4 to be tilt up 4 mix product pulverize

Metro Parks

Amount:

$500.00

$700.00

$500.00

$700.00

Note: *A11 fields to be rolled and sprayed at later date for grass and weeds.

Product, Labor, Spray

Total Donated: $2400.00



Bowman, Michael

From:
Sent:

To:
Cc:
Subject:

Starch, Marty
Monday, April 28, 2014 4:51 PM
Conroy, James T; Bowman, Michael
Canuel, Jason T

RE: NDF Funding for Sun Valley Ball field Rehabilitation

Yes we will accept these funds for this work-thanks.

From: Conroy, James T
Sent: Monday, April 28, 2014 4:49 PM
To: Bowman, Michael; Starch, Marty
Cc: Canuel, Jason T
Subject: Re: NDF Funding for Sun Valley Ball field Rehabilitation

Yes. This is a correct amount

From: Bowman, Michael
Sent: Monday, April 28, 2014 04:46 PM
To: Starch, Marty
Cc: Conroy, James T; Canuel, Jason T
Subject: NDF Funding for Sun Valley Ball field Rehabilitation

Marty,

SW Baseball approached us to fund,as we have is past years, the labor and materials for Parks to rehab the ball fields at
Sun Valley Park. Their request totals $2400.00
Will Parks accept this funding for this project?

Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office ofCouncilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council I District 14

p: 502.574.1114
e: michael.bowman@louisvillekv.gQV

City Hall
601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
Louisville, Kentucky 40202


