Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

| Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[1 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[1 paving Fund (PAV)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

| Amount: $3436.20 Date: 7/21/2016

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Capital Infrastructure Funds will be directed to Public Works and Assets for costs
associated with the repair of 3 sidewalks located, 8802 Cottingham Way (Rated
5), 2013 Floradora Dr, and 7003 Ethan Allen Way (Rated 4), all within District 14.

City Agency:  Public Works and Assets
Contact Person:  Craig Allen

Agency Phone: (502) 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

14 &M&ﬁ’m{ﬁm @ $3436.20 7/21/2016

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name:  public Works and Assets

Program/Project Name: District 14 Sidewalk Repairs
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(S)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

RequeSt Form: If matchi“ng funds are to be used, are théyk‘kcklkiksclbsekd with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will

own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes

probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

and description of cost? Yes

Prepared by: ,'/-\ Date: 7/21/2016

Effective July 2015






Bowman, Michael

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Michael,

Here are the estimates you requested. If Councilwoman Fowler is able to fund these repairs I'll be the project manager.

Allen, Craig L

Friday, July 15, 2016 4:23 PM
Bowman, Michael

RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Flag for follow up
Flagged

Thank you,
SR# 4466882
LOCATION 2013 Floradora Dr
REQUESTED BY Dist 14
RATE 4
DATE SENT 7/15/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
4'x4" of sw, 14'x4' of dw, seed and
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,279.47

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will require
re-inspection.

SR# 4494786

LOCATION 8802 Cottingham Way

REQUESTED BY Dist 14

RATE 5

DATE SENT 7/15/2016

ESTIMATE BY CA

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 11'x5' of dw, seed and protection

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $813.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date

sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.
SR# 4352590
LOCATION 7003 Ethan Allen Way
REQUESTED BY Dist 14
RATE 4
DATE SENT 7/15/2016
ESTIMATE BY CA
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 19'x4' of dw, seed and protection
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ESTIMATE AMOUNT I $1,343.73

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date
sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

Craig Allen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works
574-6159

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2016 10:59 AM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Good Morning Craig,
Just following up on these estimate requests.
We would like to get funding transfer paperwork for the repairs in at our next business deadline.

| appreciate your help!
Please let me know if you have any questions or concerns.
Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall
e: michael.bowman@Ilouisvilleky.gov 601 West lefferson Street, Ste. 307
w: www.louisvilleky.gov/district14 Louisville, Kentucky 40202

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 1:59 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Hi Michael,

You have the right person. I'll take care of these estimates for you. It will take about a week.
Thanks!

Craig Allen

Engineer |
Louisville Metro Public Works



574-6159

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Tuesday, July 05, 2016 1:57 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: Sidewalk Repairs

Craig,

Councilwoman Fowler would like to move on funding repairs for 3 sidewalks. | have previous estimates of cost, however,
I would like updated info prior to introducing paperwork for Council consideration. Is that something that you could
provide for me?

The projects are as follows (with previous estimates):

1. 8802 Cottingham Way $575.00
2. 7003 Ethan Allen Way $2260.00
3. 2013 Floradora Dr. $1840.00

Please let me know if these figures are good, or if there are updates estimates that | can use in making the transfer
request.

If you aren’t the appropriate person for this information, | would appreciate it if you forwarded this to the appropriate
person.
Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall
e: michael.bowman®@Iouisvilleky.gov 601‘W'est Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
w: www.louisvilleky.gov/district14 Louisville, Kentucky 40202







Bowman, Michael

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 2:58 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Mike,

Yes, DPW will accept the funding.

Craig Allen

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Public Works
574-6159

From: Bowman, Michael

Sent: Thursday, July 21, 2016 2:57 PM
To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Craig,

I have filed the paperwork with the Council clerk to have District 14 funding transferred to Public Works. It will be placed
on the next Appropriations Committee meeting in 2 weeks. | just will need confirmation that Public Works will accept
the funding for this project?

A response to this email will suffice.

Thanks!

Michael Bowman | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilwoman Cindi Fowler
Louisville Metro Council | District 14

p: 502.574.1114 City Hall
e: michael.bowman@Iouisvilleky.gov 601 West Jefferson Street, Ste. 307
w: www.louisvilleky.gov/district14 Louisville, Kentucky 40202

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Friday, July 15, 2016 4:23 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repairs

Michael,
Here are the estimates you requested. If Councilwoman Fowler is able to fund these repairs I'll be the project manager.

Thank you,






Bowman, Michael

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Friday, July 22, 2016 1:12 PM
To: Bowman, Michael

Subject: D14 Sidwalk Repairs CIF
Michael,

Please sign the CIF paperwork on my behalf for the Sidewalk repairs.
Thanks!

Thank you,

Councilwoman Cindi Fowler

Louisville Metro Council | District 14
p:(502) 574-1114

e: cindi.fowler@Ilouisvilleky.gov







