Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
\/Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

LPrimary Sponsor: -~ her;, R. H-qm,,' ] Y
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Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

City Ageney: D L Jie Waks ¢ Yasotr

Contact Person: 5‘% H Femsdo
Bgency Phone: (5‘02) 577_ g//é

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: ‘?Ml,, C Wwes t+ }q—-gsg,‘f'S

Program/Project Name: J,H ,gm ?W/a,,\j )QGW%M Tras L\ thaa _

Shadnee

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
- funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost?
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Hamilton, Cheri

————— =
From: Hamilton, Cheri
Sent: ' Wednesday, June 6, 2018 12:52 PM
To: Fenster, Steve A
Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra; Brown, Jeffrey E; Sullivan, Kimberly L; Baldon, Antonio J Sr
Subject: RE: decorative trash cans ‘

Include 5 extra liners at $140.00 each at a cost of $700.00 total.
Thanks!

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 4:03 PM

To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra; Brown, Jeffrey E; Sullivan, Kimberly L; Baldon, Antonio J Sr
Subject: RE: decorative trash cans

They will be serviced weekly

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 3:53 PM

To: Hamilton, Cheri <Cheri.Hamilton@louisvilleky.govs>

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra <Myra.Friend-Ellis@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Sullivan,
Kimberly L <Kimberly.Sullivan@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Baldon, Antonio J Sr <Antonio.BaldonSr@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: decorative trash cans

Councilwoman Hamilton,
Cost for decorative cans is $8,970.00 . | can get a liner for each, so you might need spares later on. They are 5140.00
each. I’'m checking on the service route for each now.

I’'m copying Mr. Jeff Brown so he can have an inspector check each location to ensure proper clearance and for a
suitable surface for mounting.

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 3:33 PM

To: Fenster, Steve A <Steve.Fenster@louisvilleky.govs

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra <Myra.Friend-Ellis@louisvilleky.sov>
Subject: decorative trash cans

I need to order some additional decorative trash cans and liners for the Portland neighborhood. Please prepare an
invoice to advise how much money | should appropriate for this purpose. | assume that these locations are on routes
that SWMS will pick up the trash cans once a week.

The 14 locations are:
SE Rudd and Cedar Grove Court
SE 26" & Montgomery Ave.
SE 29" & Bank St.
SW 26" & Northwestern Parkway
SE 26" & Bank
NW 27 & Portland Ave.



SW 29" & Portland Ave.

SW 26™ & Cornwall

NE 33" & Bank

SW 26" & Cornwall

NE 33 & Bank

SW 36" & Northwestern Parkway
NE 27" & Northwestern Parkway
SE 22™ & Portland

NW 26" & St. Xavier

Thank youl
Councilwoman Hamilton



Hamilton, Cheri

To: Fenster, Steve A
Subject: RE: decorative trash cans

| have 3 additional requests for decorative trash cans in the Shawnee neighborhood for an additional $1,794.00 to be
added to the appropriation for: 43" and Vermont; 40" & River Park Drive: and Amy and Market. I'm not sure of the
corner direction (SW, NW, etc.) but I'm sure they are at bus stops.

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Wednesday, June 13, 2018 2:27 PM
To: Hamilton, Cheri

Subject: FW: decorative trash cans

Good catch. Here’s the actual email.

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Tuesday, June 5, 2018 3:33 PM

To: Fenster, Steve A <Steve.Fenster@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra <Myra.Friend-Ellis@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: decorative trash cans

I need to order some additional decorative trash cans and liners for the Portland neighborhood. Please prepare an
invoice to advise how much money | should appropriate for this purpose. | assume that these locations are on routes
that SWMS will pick up the trash cans once a week.

The 14 locations are;
SE Rudd and Cedar Grove Court
SE 26" & Montgomery Ave.
SE 29" & Bank St.
SW 26™ & Northwestern Parkway
SE 26" & Bank
NW 27" & Portland Ave.
SW 29" & Portland Ave.
SW 26" & Cornwall
NE 33™ & Bank
SW 26" & Cornwall
NE 33" & Bank
SW 36™ & Northwestern Parkway
NE 27" & Northwestern Parkway
SE 22™ & Portland
NW 26" & St. Xavier

Thank you!
Councilwoman Hamilton



