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NDF022322PW15B

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett ]

| Amount: $628.00 Date: January 26, 2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
The request is for a new light installation at 413 Atwood Street. The funding will be used fora §
year lease agreement with LG&E to provide lighting for residents in the area.

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Program/Project Name:

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

Interagency Name: Public Works and Assets

Atwood-light/5 year lease agreement

account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funﬁing Source: If CIF is "’oeing fequeéted, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Seurce: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a usefil
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: [s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost?

 Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

No

No

Yes

Submitted by:

shughes

Date: Jan 26, 2022

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 12:10 PM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E

Cc Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Street Light

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Thank you Sir! We will start the appropriation sometime after the first of the year! Merry Christmas!

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 12:09 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Public Works will accept funds for the 5-Year LGE street light lease at 413 Atwood St

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 S 5™ St, 4™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
(502}574-0065

Cell (502)773-3222

Jeffrey. Brown@]louisvitleky.gov

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, December 23, 2021 11:47 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Jeff, just checking on this!

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Friday, December 17, 2021 3:17 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilieky.gov>
Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan. Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Hi Jeff!
Councilman Triplett wants to fund this new light instaliment. Wili Public Works accept the funds?

From: Luckett, Daniel R
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:21 AM



To: Brown, leffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Got it! Stay tuned!

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey. Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:17 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Least expensive would be $10.47 per month with a minimum 5-Year lease so the total appropriation would be $628.20

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15,2021 11:13 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Can you give me the cost again?

From: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:10 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

I wouldn’t need to inspect, we can turn it over to LGE as soon as its funded

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:07 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

Let me talk to the Councilman and I'll get back. If we were to fund do you need to inspect first?

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:06 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subhject: RE: Street Light

There’s an existing wood pole so it can likely be placed but since this is a dead end street with VERY LOW traffic volume
it likely wouldn’t benefit much from a light other than residence comfort.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:03 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light




Can a street light be placed at 413 if funded?

From: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, December 15, 2021 11:02 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Street Light

It looks like a regular street light request. We would need funding to add new street lights but property owners do have
the option to lease LGE street fights at the same rate that Metro does. The yellow dots on the map are existing street
lights on Atwood, sorry | couldn’t get road names on there.



Name  Allen Warren

Address Ei

417 Atwood St.
LOUISVILLE, KY 40217

United States

Phone  (502) 541-6157

Number

Email ALLEN WARRENS@GMAIL.COM

Comments

Hello, maybe your office can help me in regards to adding a new street light on my street. Specifically in front of the
address of 413 Atwood 5t on an existing utility pole. Back in the spring | contacted Metro 311, public works and LG&E.
Received a work order number, and never heard anything back. After a few months, | contacted Metro 311 to check the
status. They had no record of a request being made. 311 then sent me over to public works where | was informed that
LG&E needs to be contacted. Upon speaking with LG&E, they said that a request needs to be approved from Metro and
Public works before said light would be installed on a city street. As you can tell, this turned into an endless loop where
no one was able to give me any information or updates. Everyone | spoke with couldn't point me in the right direction to
get this accomplished. At that point | contacted your office via voice-mail and once again | never heard anything back.
At that point, | gave up out of frustration. The concern | and a few neighbors have and the reason we were wanting the
additional street light, is that our street (Atwood) dead-ends into interstate 65 at 413 Atwood Street. The dead-end is
very dark and at times con the states side on the states fence is overgrown. In the past we've had issues with homeless
and others passing through Louisville setting up camp in these overgrown and dark areas. Recently, Metro or the state
has added "no camping” signs to the interstate right of way and that seems to have helped with the folks setting up
camp. However, the dead end of Atwood Streel still remains dark and a safety hazard to residents. Is there anyway vour

office can see about adding a street fight to the utility pole in front of 413 Atwood?

Thank you in advance for your assistance

Allen Warren





