Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
U Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF) '
[2” Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: (' K . ?mm/ct‘ Bl s § s . |
| Amount: # 70 /) = Date: 7/:,//5 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
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| have reviewed this request for an expendrture of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman ' Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only: _
Request Amount: ~ Amended Amount:
Reference #: : To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
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To Project Manager: Completion Date:
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name:
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Request Form: lIs the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?
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Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount?

M

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building

or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. /ﬁ{//;)
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If =

not, the funding source is probably NDF. =
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007 2/ /)

Ordinance Required: Is the request a 'transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?
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Hamilton, Cheri
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From: Hackett, Keith

Sent: Friday, July 31, 2015 9:08 AM
To: Hamilton, Cheri; Fenster, Steve A
Subject: RE: trash can liners

Itis always wise to buy extras just in case you come across one in the near future. | would suggest purchasing 5 to
10. We will keep them for you and replace when needed.

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Friday, July 31, 2015 8:55 AM
To: Fenster, Steve A; Hackett, Keith
Subject: RE: trash can liners

I will fund replacing the liners. Do you happen to know of any others that are missing that | don’t know about so | can
replace them too?
Thanks!

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Thursday, July 30, 2015 2:10 PM
To: Hackett, Keith; Hamilton, Cheri
Subject: RE: trash can liners

Currently they are $140 each from our supplier.

From: Hackett, Keith

Sent: Thursday, July 30, 2015 2:07 PM
To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Fenster, Steve A

Subject: RE: trash can liners

OK we will send you this information on the price of the liners.

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Hamilton, Cheri" <Cheri.Hamilton@]ouisvilleky.gov>
Date: 07/30/2015 2:02 PM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Hackett, Keith" <Keith.Hackett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: trash can liners

Hi Keith,

| have two locations in the Shawnee neighborhood that are missing the liners for the designer neighborhood garbage
cans we purchased for Shawnee. They are at Southwestern Parkway @ River Park Drive and W. Muhammad Ali Blvd @
S. 43" St. People are still continuing to use those cans and the trash is coming out onto the area since there is nothing
to contain the trash in the can. | am happy to replace the liners if you tell me how much they are. Thanks for your
attention to this request.



