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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name:

tProgram/PrOJectName /A 5’;/ P-?;,‘{;; TP -~ Sﬁ{j L»U @ MZ&

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? §\§ f A
' Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the o ' /
request form description? [ A
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching ;
fund amount? N /A

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

;\/A

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
- not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Neo

Ordinance Requlred Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?

5*\://%

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

e S i)

Effective October 2013




SHELLIE MAY
Legislative Aide | Metro Council District 7
Gor West Jefferson St | Louisville, K'Y 40202

Office: soz-s74-1ue7 | Fax: so2-574-4501
Email: Shellie. May@LouisvilleKY.gov

From: Adams, Mark [mailto:madams@ridetarc.org]

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2013 9:23 AM

To: May, Shellie

Subject: Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements - Shelbyville Rd. (I-264 to Thierman Lane)

Hello Shellie:

I wanted to follow-up on our conversation from last week. As discussed, TARC and Public Works are improving the bus

stops along Shelbyville Rd. We have been working with St. Matthews and District 7 on this project for the past 3 years.

The Stops in District 7 noted in the spreadsheet are stops #1,3,5 & 7. The 20% match for these improvements would be
$7,628.07.

There were funds allocated as part of the budget several years ago and there should still be about 6,000 left in this
account. Enclosed is the previous e-mail from Jennifer {6-21-11) concerning funding.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thanks,

Mark W. Adams, P.E.

TARC, Planning Department
1000 W. Broadway
Louisville Ky. 40203

(502) 561-5109

(502) 213-3253 (fax)

From: Osborne, Jennifer [mailto:Jennifer.Osborne@Ilouisvilleky.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 2:34 PM

To: Adams, Mark

Subject: FW: 149207

Mark,

We have plenty of money in the account to cover the cost of the Rudy Lane/Brownsboro Road bench. Actually, after
that bench is placed we will still have more than $6,000 in that account. We will use that to start the Shelbyville Road
project and if additional funds are needed we will use District 7 NDF.

Thanks!

Jennifer

Jennifer L. Osborne

Legislative Assistant

Councilman Ken Fleming

574-1107

From: Tipton, Ben

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 2:08 PM



May, Shellie

From: Adams, Mark <madams@ridetarc.org>

Sent: Monday, January 06, 2014 8:34 AM

To: May, Shellie

Ce: Fleming, Ken

Subject: RE: Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements - Shelbyville Rd. (I-264 to Thierman Lane)
Attachments: Bus Stop Improvements - District 7 - Shelbyvifle Rd. (12-11-13).xls; District 8 & 10 -

Metro Council Approval.pdf

Good Morning:

Enclosed is the cost summary spreadsheet with the stops highlighted that are within District 7. The sidewalk and bus
stop improvements use Federal Funds and the breakdown is 80% TARC and 20% local Match. | am including some
example pdf’s of the approvals for other locations. These matching funds wouid be designated as CIF Funds and
managed by Public Works. The cost summary is as follows :

1) Total preliminary project cost = $68,486.40 (stops #1 - #12) /’TMMW
2) District 7 total preliminary cost = $38,140.33 (stops #1,#3, #5, & #7) j / E %M
3) District 7 (20% match) = $7,62807 é 3oL /\/\\f' =

/’/j
Please give me a call if you have any oons.

|

| | (_

Thanks, i h

%
\
!
|
|

Mark W. Adams, P.E.

TARGC, Planning Department
1000 W. Broadway
Louisville Ky. 40203

(502) 561-5109

(502) 213-3253 (fax)

From: May, Shellie [mailto: Shellie.May@louisvilleky.gov] o
Sent: Friday, January 03, 2014 1:51 PM
To: Adams, Mark

Subject: RE: Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements - Shelbyville Rd. (I-264 to Thierman Lane)

Mark, as of Dec. 16" the, the balance in the account is $4,322.34 for D7 TARC Projects. CM Fleming would like to know
the following:

1. Total dollars needed for the project.
2. Current dollars committed to project.
3. What is the remaining dollars needed to complete this project.

Thanks,



To: Osborne, Jennifer
Subject: RE: 149207

As of today the balance is $6,827.26

From: Osborne, Jennifer

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 1:13 PM

To: Tipton, Ben

Subject: 149207

Ben,

Can you tell me the balance of 149207, D7 TARC Bus Stop Improvements?
Thank you!

Jennifer

Jennifer L. Osborne
Legislative Assistant
Councilman Ken Fleming
574-1107



W@d%(@ A lame

May, Shellie

From: Adams, Mark <madams@ridetarc.org>

Sent: Monday, December 16, 2013 9:23 AM

To: May, Shellie

Subject: Bus Stop and Sidewalk Improvements - Shelbyville Rd. (I-264 to Thierman Lane)
Attachments: Outback Shelter - pic.1.JPG; Outback Shelter - pic.2.JPG; Outback Shelter - pic.3.JPG; St.

Matthews Bench - pic 2.JPG; Bus Stop Improvements - District 7 - Shelbyville Rd.
(12-11-13).xIs

M@w af for D Tare progets

I wanted to follow up on our conversation from last week. As discussed, TARC and Public Works are improving the bus
stops along Shelbyville Rd. We have been working with St. Matthews and District-7-on-this project for the past 3 years.
__The Stops in District 7 noted in the spreadsheet are stops #1,3,5 & 7. The 20% match for these improvements would be
(" $7,628.07

Hello Shellie:

There were funds allocated as part of the budget several years ago and there should still be about 6,000 left in this
account. Enclosed is the previous e-mail from Jennifer (6-21-11) concerning funding.

Please let me know if you have any questions.

Thanks,

Mark W. Adams. P.E. Q?\Si

TARC, Planning Department
1000 W. Broadway

Louisville Ky. 40203 } '(O
(502) 561-5109 ﬁ ij\ﬁf&

(502) 213-3253 (fax)

From: Osborne, Jennifer [mailto:Jennifer.Osborne@louisvilleky.gov] 614/)&/\/@ Oj
Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 2:34 PM / 5 ]
To: Adams, Mark

Subject: FW: 149207

). &)

Mark,

We have plenty of money in the account to cover the cost of the Rudy Lane/Brownsboro Road bench. Actually, after
that bench is placed we will still have more than $6,000 in that account. We will use that to start the Shelbyville Road
project and if additional funds are needed we will use District 7 NDF.

Thanks!

Jennifer

Jennifer L.. Osborne
Legislative Assistant
Councilman Ken Fleming
574-1107



From: Tipton, Ben

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 2:08 PM
To: Osborne, Jennifer

Subject: RE: 149207

As of today the balance is $6,827.26

From: Osborne, Jennifer

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2011 1:13 PM
To: Tipton, Ben

Subject: 149207

Ben,

Can you tell me the balance of 149207, D7 TARC Bus Stop Improvements?
Thank you!

Jennifer

Jennifer L. Osborne
Legislative Assistant
Councilman Ken Fleming
574-1107
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