Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
XINeighborhood Development Fund
[ICapital Infrastructure Fund

[ ] Municipal Aid Pro

|irimary Sponsor: Councilman David Tandy

| Amount: $ D25, 43 Date: October 8, 2014
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Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and an
This interagency request is for the 10" Annual Willie Bright Resource Fair, which is to be held on
October 11, 2014 in Sheppard Park. The event is being sponsored by Councilman Tandy and is
free and open to the public. The resource fair brings together various metro agencies and
organizations to provide information, services, and resources to help the local community. The
aforementioned amount is to pay for the facility rental of Sheppard Park, food, and Inflatables

Y external grantee(s):

Location of project/program: Sheppard Park, 1601 Magazine Street

City Agency: Louisville Metro Parks

Contact Person: Robyn Richards

Agency Phone: 502 368-5910

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the

funds will be uiﬂu ic pur ;
4

$J305.83F 12-%-f

District # Council Member %ignature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:

To Project Manager:

Completion Date:

Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
| Department/Project:
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Smith, Chanelle Emily

——— T —x
From: King, Keidra
Sent: Monday, November 03, 2014 12:42 PM
To: Smith, Chanelle Emily
Subject: Fwd: Willie Bright Resource Fair
Attachments: image001.gif; image001.gif
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Keidra D. King
Please excuse typos
Sent from my iPhone

Your voice can change the world.
—President Barack Obama, 44

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Richards, Robyn" <Robyn.Richards@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: November 3, 2014 at 12:41:04 PM EST

To: "King, Keidra" <Keidra.King@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Willie Bright Resource Fair

Metro Parks will accept $2,308.87 for the Willie Bright event on Oct. 11, 2014 at Shepherd Park.

Thanks,

Ralbyn Richards
Special Event Coondinaton
1080 mphitheaten Rd
Louisuitte HY 40214
FPhane 502 365-597C
Faa 502 3685955

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Friday, October 31, 2014 11:58 AM
To: Richards, Robyn

Subject: FW: Willie Bright Resource Fair



_ NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST |

Interagency Name Lomswiie Metro Parks

Pl‘ﬂgl‘ﬂmfPl'Oject Name Wllhe Bnght Resource Falr

. | Yes/No/NA
Request Form Is the NDF Request Sloned by all Councll Member(s) Appropnatmg Fundmg'? I yes
Request Form: If matchlng funds are to be used are they disclosed with account numbers in the F
request form description? i =
Request Form: If matchmg funds are to be used does the amount of the request exclude the matehmg |
fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this prOJect are they disclosed with account numbers i in
the Tequest form descnptlon'? L
= Fundmg Source: If CIF is bemg requested does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estale bulldmg
or equlpment‘? If not, the fundmg source is probabl}/ NDF. ha
Fundmg Source: If CIF is being requested does the pTOjeCt have a useful life of more than one year" If
not, the funding source is probably NDF. i na
] Ordinance Requnred Is the NDF request toa Metro Agency greater than $5 000‘? No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount glven for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less? 7 | "°
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Prepared by Keldra ng Date 1 0/8/2014
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Effective October 2013




