
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

^ Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

<^~^

Primary Sponsor: Dan Johnson

M t̂u
ithAmount: $7,000 (or $3500 with hg funds allocated) Date: July 18,2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Paving of alley way oryW(. Wellington on the north side of the 100 block, which runs behind
101-109

^^
I want $3500 in MAP funding and $3500 from Alley Paving Leap Account number 8101 410
8210148250822702

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 502-574-6789
^v^

I have reviewed this request for an expend iture/itff^ity tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public pupj^ose. / /

2\ ^S. ^00
District # Council Member Signature Amount

-7-11-^'
Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:
Date

Request Amount:

Referenced fYlAP^Dl^l^W^l
Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Department/Project:

Revised July 2013
DATE?.7' ._M



NDF OR GIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: -f^^ ^ ^ uQpr )c5 t-_|YsS^-V ^
pr^ram/proJectName: A|l<;^ f)c<^'_i^

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amoimt? 1^^
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request fonn description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000?

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Yes/No/NA

^A
^s

_1^
V|C5
^l^s

WF
/J//^

fw^^^\^^^^M^^^^_^^__^^^^

Effective October 2013



Mathews, Bryan L

From:
Sent:

To:
Subject:

Nichols, Barbara J

Wednesday, June 11, 2014 1:59 PM
Mathews, Bryan L
FW: W. Wellington - Alley estimate request

We need to check with Dan to see if this is a project he wanted to proceed with.

From: Nichols, Barbara J
Sent: Wednesday, June 11, 2014 12:43 PM
To: Nichols, Barbara J
Subject: R/V: W. Wellington - Alley estimate request

From: Metcalfe, Andrew
Sent: Tuesday, June 03, 2014 2:39 PM
To: Nichols, Barbara J
Cc: Morgan, Briana S
Subject: RE: W. Wellington - Alley estimate request

Barbara,

Per Briana's request belowj^the cost to repavethe alley is $7,0001 Let me know if you have any questions or need further
information.

Thanks,

Andrew

From: Morgan, Briana S
Sent: Thursday, May 29, 2014 10:03 AM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew
Subject: RE: W. Wellington - Alley estimate request

I apologize. I'm not sure how I didn't see those. Thanks for forwarding me that. I searched my mailbox, high and low,
before I sent anything about an update. It's the North side of the 100 block, which runs behind 101 through 109.

Thanks for letting me know what I left out,
Briana

From: Metcalfe, Andrew
Sent: Thursday, May 29, 2014 9:38 AM
To: Morgan, Briana S
Subject: RE: W. Wellington - Alley estimate request

Briana,

Please see the attached, I'm not sure I ever received an address for the alley.

Thanks,
Andrew



#57 Alley Paying: All Districts

Appropriations
Date Passed

7/1/2014

Leap^ccount number 8101 410 8210 148250 822702

Reference #

FY15 Appropriation
FY15 Unappropriated Balance^

l'._

Brief Description
6/30/14 Balance
FY15 Appropriation

''^s^.^ S3°^

^ttor^ V\eAj^
Useoffundsarelimjtedto$1^p0^pe7district^urmg^YT5^nYfirs
AfteLMarc^31^20J5 the match funds areavaiTaye^on^

Amount

$ 40,000.00

Balance
i- 750.00
$ 40,750.00

40,750.00

$- ~ -^
$ 40,750.00

.ch 31, 2015.



ff57 AueYJPavi"q:A" DistriRts I Lfeap^ccount number 8101 410 8210 148250 822702

'ADDropriations
Date Passed

7/1/2014

Reference #

_J_.
R< 15 Appropriation
FY1^ Unappropriated Balance

Use^f funds are limited tq^15^00]3CTdisWctdunng~FY1r5~orTa fir?
AftCTMarch3lL2015 the match funds areavailableon'afirsFcome^

-lJfsw)?Z)^

^^rfsl^e/u^

Amount

$ 40,000.00

Balance
£ 750.00

40,750.00
40;756.00-

$--"~~"~
$ 40,750700

.ch 31, 2015.

^E^-


