
Primary Sponsor:

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

X Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Jim King

Amount: $700.00 Date: July 10, 2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

For Parks to install a concrete footer in Camp Taylor Park for the placement of a
monument.

City Agency:

Contact Person:

Agency Phone:

Metro Parks

Marty Storch

456-8176

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman
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Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:
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Funds Returned:
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Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Starch, Marty
Wednesday, July 02, 2014 8:29 AM
Peers, Carrie G; Schuhmann, Paul
RE: Monument

Follow up
Completed

Our estimated cost for building this is between $550 - $700. Largest cost is for small delivery truck of concrete. And our
staff can build this. Please let us know how you want us to proceed.

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Monday, June 30, 2014 3:10 PM
To: Starch, Marty; Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: Monument

Marty,

I believe Paul got you the measurements you needed. Have you been able to determine if you will be able to do the
footer? Pres. King has a neighborhood meeting on Wednesday and I know he will be asked about it. Was hoping to be
able to give them an answer.

Thanks,

Carrie

From: Starch, Marty
Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2014 1:34 PM
To: Schuhmann, Paul; Peers, Carrie G
Subject: RE: Monument

Do we know width - other than 2" wider. I am just tr/ing to make sure what it takes, because it is more than just
concrete depth. I have limited knowledge for engineering but what I do know gets me in trouble or what I think I know
at times, because there is a rock base, compaction of this and sometimes different materials are added to concrete pour
to give added strength to concrete. I have a staff meeting in AM and will ask these questions but I really do need to get
width established so we can figure out cost.

From: Schuhmann, Paul
Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2014 1:19 PM
To: Starch, Marty; Peers, Carrie G
Subject: RE: Monument

The monument people said it would take 2 feet.........previous companies said the same thing

From: Starch, Marty
Sent: Tuesday, June 17, 2014 1:17 PM
To: Peers, Carrie G
Cc: Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: Monument



NDF OR GIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Name: Parks

1 Program/Project Name: Monument

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

n/a

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
I fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
1 or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

n/a

ii/a

Yes

I Funding Source: IfCIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If [ ^.^
not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? n/a

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

n/a

Prepared by: Date:

Effective October 2013


