Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

OO0

l Primary Sponsor: James Peden

l Amount: $96.00 Date: 12-1-15

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funds will be used to remove a dead Bradford Pear tree located in the easement
at 8212 Smyrna Parkway.

These funds are in addition to the $768 approved on by Appropriations Committee
on 10-13-15 in NDF101315PW23 to account # 1103-506-3320-333023-401101
for a total of $864 to be used for removal of this tree.

City Agency:  Public Works and Assets
Contact Person: ~ Russell Stevens

Agency Phone: 574-3383

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

28 W%) 2-1—1S

District # ncil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: . Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Pyblic Works and Assets

Program/Project Name: Remove dead pear tree in easement at 8212 Smyrna Pkww
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this pfoject, are they ‘
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will -
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding sourceis = NA
probably NDF,
Funding Source: If CIFis being requestéd, does the project have a useful ‘
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ NA
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF reduest to a Metro Agency greater than -
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. ; No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

k Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? Yes
Prepared by: John N Torsky I Date:  12-1-15

Eect
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Jaé Ray fom;pcm# Qne.
“No Job Too Small, No Tree Too Tall”

www.bobrayco.com

Customer Name LOU Metro Altn: Russ Date 11-20-15

Phone Gl _965-6628 Fax

Job Location City State Zip
Billing Address (If different) on file Email

-Specifications for Cortract (or) Estimates

Loc: 1553 Gallagher Street
1). Remove 20" Honey Locust tree with stump.  $768.00
Loc: 8212 Smyrna Road

2). Remove 27" dead Pear tree with stump.  $864.00

Wi'e propose (o furnish ;Iné%nﬂ lébdr and equipment to complete work in accordance with above specdications The Bob Ray Co., Ing.'s estimated cost of e performance of the tasks
presented akowe 5 $ Should there be any reason to madify the scope of work. the Bob Ray Company, Inc. wil seek your approval with a revised estimated cos

beforg comemnencing any such additonal wark

Ework 1s 0 be completed in a workmardike manngr. Al agreements are contingent upon weather accidents and other delays beyond our control - See reverse saie for the terms ang
dhions of work to be performed. The above price(s) #nd specitication(s) are sausfgeiory and hereby accepted You are authonged (0 do the work as specifisd

Gt

This agresment and any noted allachments consitistes the entire agreerment between the Bob Ray T, Inc and the beiow signed concerning the Siébjf:\.t matter hgrest Trag
suuersedes alt pror agreements, discussons. represeniations. warrankes and covenanis between the Parties with respect o the above spe were  Thee are 85
representations, covenants or agreements, expressed or impiied between ihe parties except those expressty set forth in this agreement Any amendments or
agreement shall be in writing and executed by the coatracting parties

Yo signatiee below wi constitide a binng contract

Bob Ray Co.

Represantative’s Signature ‘ Customer's Signature

11-20-2015 ate

Cate

723 Lyndon Lane + Louisville, KY » 40222 » Phone: 502.425.7654 + Fax: 502.425.7657
CUSTOMER COPY

IS

} e



Torsky, John N

From: Stevens, Russell G.

Sent: Tuesday, December 01, 2015 9:40 AM
To: Torsky, John N

Subject: FW: quote for tree work
Attachments: SKM_C224e15112013140.pdf

John,

Here is the bid for the removal on Smyrna. Please let me know if you would like to proceed and when funds have been
appropriated. Thanks!

From: Charlotte Dawson [mailto:cdawson@bobrayco.com]
Sent: Friday, November 20, 2015 2:26 PM

To: Stevens, Russell G.

Subject: quote for tree work

Thank you,
Charlotte




Torsky, John N

From: Stevens, Russell G.

Sent: Friday, September 11, 2015 11:.04 AM
To: Torsky, John N

Subject: 8212 Smyrna S/R 4515855

John,

The tree in question is an easement tree. If you'd like to use our city contractor for the removal, the approximate cost
would be $768 which includes stump removal. Please let me know if you'd like to proceed. Thanks!

DIVISION OF

- COMMUNITY
" FORESTRY

Offlos of Sustainability — Lowdeville Forwaed

Russell G. Stevens

Louisville Metro Arborist

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0790A

Division of Community Forestry- Louisville Forward
527 W. Jefferson St. 6™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-3383

Russell.Stevens@louisvilleky.gov




