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0-063-22

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman-Jessica Green. DiStrict | B
[ Amount: $ 10,000 Date: 02/14/2022 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
The funds requested are to be used for Emergency repairs in District 1 and those repairs are done
by Metro Housing resource center @ 2810 Dumesnil Ave Louisville KY40211 . Develop Louisville/
Louisville Forward will administer the funds to Metro Housing resource center .

City Agency: Develop Louisville / Louisville Forward
Contact Person: Marilyn Harris  Director

Agency Phone: 502 574 3737

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the r ncerning the Eo'gﬁe{&%&f__
- t

(- )
1 B 1 $10,000 02/1412022
District # Coungil Member Signature Amount Date
J

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _O0-063-22 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
Page |
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Interagency Name: Develop Louisville /Louisville Forward

Program/Project Name:

Metro Housing Resource Center Emergency repairs in D1

Yes/No/NA
| Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) “
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
 disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
- funding source is probably NDF.

:7 Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Yes

- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Mo~ 1/es

- Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes

Submitted by: Charles Weathers

Revised May 2016




Weathers, Charles

From: Harris, Marilyn S.

Sent: Friday, February 11, 2022 2:38 PM

To: OBrien, Jeff, Weathers, Charles

Subject: RE: Metro Housing Resource Center ( District 1 emergency repairs )

Yes, we will accept.

Marilyn S. Harris

Director, Develop Louisville
444 S. 5' Street, Suite 300
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-3737

Email: Marilyn.Harris@louisvilleky.gov

DEVELOP
LOUISVILLE

LOUISVILLE FORWARD

NTN! No Thanks Necessary! Please help reduce e-mail overload! No need to respond with a thanks!

From: OBrien, Jeff <jeff.OBrien@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 11, 2022 11:40 AM

To: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Harris, Marilyn S. <Marilyn.Harris@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Metro Housing Resource Center ( District 1 emergency repairs )

Hi Charles —

’'m copying Marilyn Harris. She is the Director of Develop Louisville now and can speak to the department’s willingness
to administer the funds. 'm sure it’s not an issue, but will let her make that decision.

Thank you,
Jeff
Jeff O'Brien, Chief

LOUISVILLE FORWARD
Ph. 502.574.1354




From: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, February 11,2022 11:12 AM

To: OBrien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Metro Housing Resource Center ( District 1 emergency repairs )

Morning Mr Obrien, | am reaching out to see if Develop Louisville will accepts and administer funds from
Councilwoman Jessica Green for emergency repairs in district 1 to Metro Housing Resource Center, If you have any
questions | can be reached at 502 468 5982 . C Weathers




Weathers, Charles

e
From: Harris, Marilyn S.
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 1:.06 PM
To: Weathers, Charles
Cc: OBrien, Jeff; Robinson, Justin A; Grabowski, Laura
Subject: RE: Request to administer funds to  MHRC

Thank you, we will take it from there!

Marilyn S. Harris

Director, Develop Louisville
444 S. 5% Street, Suite 300
Louisvilie, KY 40202
(502)574-3737

Email: Marilyn.Harris@louisvilleky.gov

DEVELOP
LOUISVILLE

LOUISVILLE FORWARD

NTN! No Thanks Necessary! Please help reduce e-mail overload! No need to respond with a thanks!

From: Weathers, Charles <Charles.Weathers@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 12:33 PM

To: Harris, Marilyn S. <Marilyn.Harris@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: OBrien, Jeff <Jeff.OBrien@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Request to administer funds to MHRC

Afternoon, I am reaching to inform you that the amount CW Green is sending over is $10,000. C Weathers






