Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Frimary Sponsor: Jim King J

[ Amount: $500.00 Date: July 10, 2014 B

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

For the purchase and installation of a bike rack by Public Works to be located in the right
of way at 1038 Lydia St.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Dirk Gowin
Agency Phone: 574-5925

L

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a public purpose.
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Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: | Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Bikehauser.com,llc
'@ , 1331 Hull Street QUOte

(Z2WINS]  Louisville KY 40204
P.502.767.8477
dave®@bikehauser.com

Quote Number: 10033
issue Date: 07/03/2014
Salesperson: Dave Bibelhauser

Louisville Metro Public Works
444 South 5th Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Qty | Item Code Description Unit Price Total
1 | signature rack powder coat Single Loop "Signature" Bike Rack powder $400.00 $400.00
coated (brown) for Oid Hickory Inn, 1038
Lydia St, Louisville, KY 40217
1 | Install Install Single Loop "Signature" Rack $100.00 $100.00
Subtotal $500.00
Total Due $500.00

Thank you for your business.
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Peers, Carrie G

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2014 10:47 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G; Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: bike rack

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: ~ Flagged

Yes.

Dirk L. Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
(502) 574-5925

From: Peers, Carrie G

Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2014 8:58 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk L; Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: bike rack

Will PW accept the $500 appropriation for the installation of a bike rack in the right of way at 1038 Lydia St?

Thanks,

Carrie Peers

Legislative Assistant

District 10

Jim King, President
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1189
carrie.peers@louisvilleky.gov

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Wednesday, July 09, 2014 8:13 AM |

To: Peers, Carrie G; Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: bike rack

Dirk L. Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
{502) 574-5925

From: Peers, Carrie G

Sent: Monday, July 07, 2014 10:31 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk L; Schuhmann, Paul
Subject: RE: bike rack

Can we get the quote/invoice to show the address of the installation 1038 Lydia St?




) NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Bike Rack

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the wa
request form description?
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching wa
fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in oa
the request form description?
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building Yes
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If Ves
not, the funding source is probably NDF.
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF requestto a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007 n/a
Ordinance Required: Is the requesta transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for wa

the fiscal year $25,000 or less?
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