Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
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| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

I Amount: $ 150.00 Date: December 10, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to Metro Parks for two reflective signs for Bingham Park security cameras.

City Agency:  Metro Parks
Contact Person:  Jason Canuel

Agency Phone: 456-8113

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose, /
iﬂ_f_ééé_\ $150 12/10/15
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Two reflective signs for Bingham Park cameras
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful »
life of more than one year? if not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? Yes
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Prepared by: Date:  Decerber 10,2015

Effective July 2015




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Canuel, Jason T

Sent: Tuesday, December 08, 2015 12:24 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle; Nelson, Erika L
Subject: Fwd: Bingham Park-camera signs
Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

This is not too bad a price. What do you all think.

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smanphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Watson, Camille" <camille@usaimage.com>
Date: 12/08/2015 10:01 AM (GMT-05:00)

To: "Canuel, Jason T" <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: "Nelson, Erika L" <Erika.Nelson@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Bingham Park-camera signs

Jason if we print and cut the letters in the reflective self adhesive material and mount to the epanel
material you're looking at $75.00 per sign.

Let me know if you have any questions.
Thanks
Camille

On Fri, Dec 4, 2015 at 9:45 AM, Canuel, Jason T <Jason.Canuel@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Camille,

We are looking for a price on (2) reflective signs that read “Metro Watch Security Cameras — Recording in
Progress”. As we discussed, I think a 2°x2” sign with rounded corners would be preferred.

Jason T. Canuel

Metro Parks Assistant Director
PO Box 37280
Louisville, Kentucky 40233

502.439.7694 (Cell)
502.456.8113 (Office)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.gov




