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CIF110321PW23

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
] Primary Sponsor: James Peden

| Amount: $28,700 Date: 10-25-21

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funds will be used to repave Acme Way from Smyrna Place to Michael Ray Drive. This section of
Acme Way is rated a 43 under the PCI index which is in the "Poor" catagory.

City Agency: Puyblic Works
Contact Person: joff Brown

Agency Phone: 5740065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

23 ( oAt $28,700 10-25-21

District # ouncil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committec Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF110321PW23 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Public Works/Acme Way Repaving

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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 NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Acme Way Repaving
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) —
Appropriating Funding? Yes |~
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with _
account numbers in the request form description? NA M
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of _
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA M
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they .
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA M

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the %

. . es
funding source is probably NDF.

KR

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes :—
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than -
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA M
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? _
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA M
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid —
estimate and description of cost? Yes M
Submitted by: John Torsky Date: 10-25-21

Revised May 2016



Torskx, John N

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 8:23 AM
To: Torsky, John N; Haines, Matthew R
Subject: RE: Acme Way

Public Works will accept $28,700 to pave Acme Way from Smyrna Pl to Michael Ray Dr

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 8:17 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Acme Way

Mr. Brown,

If you get me a price for repaving Acme Way as you as Councilman Peden discussed I can get the CIF paperwork turned
in. The deadline for the next Council meeting is today at noon

Thank you
John Torsky



Harward, Sonxa

From: Torsky, John N

Sent: Tuesday, October 26, 2021 10:17 AM
To: Harward, Sonya

Subject: FW: CIF for Repaving Acme Way

Ms. Harward,
Can you please add this email to CIF for Acme Way.

Thank you,
John Torsky

John Torsky
Legislative Assistant
District 23 Metro Councilman James Peden

502-574-1123 - Office
502-574-3468 - Direct

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, October 26, 2021 7:03 AM

To: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CIF for Repaving Acme Way

Acme Way from Smyrna Pl to Michael Ray Dr is about 17,950 sf of pavement so at our unit price of $1.60/sf we estimate
about $28,700 to repave this section of roadway.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 10:00 PM

To: Brown, leffrey E <jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Fwd: CIF for Repaving Acme Way

The Clerk is asking for documentation showing how the amount for repaving Acme Way was arrived at.

John Torsky

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 8:16:44 PM

To: Torsky, John N <john.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: CIF for Repaving Acme Way




LaTonya will want to know how they came to that amount, so yes, please see if they have that tallied
somewhere, somehow.

Thanks,
Sonya

sonya Harwn ol

Louisville Metro Council Clerk
601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)
(502)500-5440 (cell)

From: Torsky, John N <John.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 8:09 PM

To: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: CIF for Repaving Acme Way

The email from Jeff Brown is all | have. Want me to ask for more details?

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 6:57:02 PM

To: Torsky, John N <john.Torsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: CIF for Repaving Acme Way

John,
Do you have the cost estimate that shows how Public Works came to the cost of $28,700 for this

repaving project?

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonya Harwa ol

Louisville Metro Council Clerk
601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-2704 (direct)
(502)574-3902 (ofc)




