CIF120821PW19B

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Piagentini ]

| Amount: $12,774.35 Date: 11/16/21 \

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Cost of paving the Metro owned section of Old Station Rd. Total cost is $12,774.35.

City Agency: public Safety Public Works
Contact Person: jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 574.0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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19 [+] % /,),,é/%’ 12,774.35 11/16/21

District # CouncilAlember Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF120821PW19B To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name:

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Paving Metro owned portion of Old Station Rd.
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MIDDLETOWN STREET PAVING BID 2021:

TOWNE CREEK ROAD

TOWNE CREEK COURT

EASTGATE VILLAGE DRIVE
CLARLAND DRIVE

MYDDLETON DRIVE

CROSSWINDS DRIVE

HARRISON AVENUE

BROTHERS AVENUE

MAIN STREET

OLD STATION ROAD (MIDDLETOWN)

TOTAL SF AND TONS

TOTAL MIDDLETOWN ROADS

METRO COST (OLD STATION ROAD)

TOTAL BID COMBINED

PREPARED BY:_

PRINTED NAME: V(€ 71 AGT

PAVING CO., INC.

SF
$31,295.60 38628
$6,837.99 8865
$36,876.57 47808
$20,784.72 26949
$27,109.00 35145
$63,543.78 72657
$15,883.58 20592
$19,611.50 25425
$52,725.77 67059
$10,204.92 13230

356,355
$284,873.44
$12,774.35
$297,647.78

DATE: /c',;/ 7// 2(

PER TON PAVING PRICE: $70.00/TON

LF MILLING PRICE: $4.25/L

TONS
354.1
81.3
438.2
247
322.2
666.0
188.8
233.1
614.7
31213

3,266.6



Smith, Chanelle Emily

From: Brown, Jeffrey E

Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 12:52 PM
To: Smith, Chanelle Emily

Cc: Haines, Matthew R; Bradley, Maxwell B.
Subject: RE: Middletown Paving

We worked with Libs Paving earlier this year to supplement paving work being done by the City of Meadow Vale and
paved a portion of a Metro road along the city’s boundary that was also being paved so we should be able to make this

work.

Public Works will accept $12,774.35 for the paving of the Metro portion of Old Station Rd and work with the City of
Middletown’s paving contractor to complete the work in conjunction with Middletown’s paving project.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Smith, Chanelle Emily <Chanelle.Smith@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 16, 2021 11:51 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: Middletown Paving

Hey Jeff,
After speaking to you and Beth it is clear we are unable to give money to Middletown for the paving of Old Station Rd.

They did already do a bid list and chose Libs paving company. They stated that our cost of paving our section of Old
Station Rd. would be $12,774.35. If | send CIF funds to you can you use this funding to pave our section of Old Station

Rd?

If we use the same contractor they would do it all at once which makes the most sense to me?
Is this doable?

Thanks so much.

Chanelle Smith | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Anthony Piagentini

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p:(502) 574-3464 p: (502) 574-11189 f: (502} 574-4501

From: Deborah Columbia <deborah@cityofmiddletownky.org>
Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2021 11:16 AM

To: Smith, Chanelle Emily <Chanelle.Smith@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Marty Stansbury <marty@cityofmiddletownky.org>
Subject: Middletown Paving

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe
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Hey Chanelle. Marty asked me to send you the attached documents. If you need anything else, let me
know.

Thanks, Deborah

Deborah Columbia
City of Middletown
City Clerk/ABC Administrator

{502) 245-2762 Wark
deborah@cityofmiddletownky.org
P.O. Box 43048

Middletown, KY 40253

www, cityofmiddletownky.org




