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CIF012622PW09
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
» Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |
| Amount: $50,000 Date: November 30, 2021 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to MPW to complete missing sections of sidewalk on Cleveland Blvd to Zorn Avenue. Also
would include new curb and gutter.

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Steve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: (502) 574-8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

9 E“ n “ ! $50,000 11/30/2021

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF012622PW09 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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 Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

- Program/Project Name:  Complete sidewalk, and add curb & gutter on Cleveland Blvd to Zorn Ave

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) N

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA
' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they :

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

 Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
 Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
' Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: L'.q(,t, ‘&(uﬂM Date: 11/30/2021

¥ L4 D ——
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Ethridge, lee

From: Kurowsky, Steve M.

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 11:58 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Gowin, Dirk L; Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: Cieveland Blvd to Zorn - sidewalk, curb and gutter

Yes, Public Works can accept the funds.

Will funding be available ASAP, or will it be available in February? | thought the Appropriations committee usually takes
December and January off?

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 11:42 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Cleveland Blvd to Zorn - sidewalk, curb and gutter

Thanks, Steve.

D9 would like to move forward with this project. Will MPW accept these funds?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

g & © 0601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
. d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 11:39 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill. Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>; Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk. Gowin@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey. Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Cleveland Blvd to Zorn - sidewalk, curb and gutter

It is still accurate

From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle Ethridge @louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 10:32 AM
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To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill. Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>; Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Cleveland Blvd to Zorn - sidewalk, curb and gutter

Good morning, Steve.

Is the below estimate for the sidewalk gap on Cleveland Blvd to Zorn still accurate?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 8 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, August 9, 2021 12:18 PM

.To: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk. Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L <Craig. Allen@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<Jeffrey.Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill. Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>; Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge ®@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Neighborhood Pedestrian Bicycle Access Committee Priority Projects

All,

The cost of new sidewalk connection along the southside of Cleveland Blvd. would be $50,000. The new sidewalk would
have to be put on a new curb & gutter along here. Drainage should not be adversely impacted here since there is an
exist. catch basin at the low point of the road already. There is a lot of Telecom equipment at the western edge of the
project site. We may require a small Perm. Sidewalk Easement from the Adams Hill Town Houses property in order to
get the new sidewalk around that equipment.

From: Gowin, Dirk L <Dirk.Gowin@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, August 6, 2021 10:30 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve M. <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>; Allen, Craig L <Craig.Allen@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey
E <jeffrey. Brown®@louisvilleky gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>; Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Neighborhood Pedestrian Bicycle Access Committee Priority Projects

Please estimate the cost for Cleveland. Thanks.

birk Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
dirk. sowin@louisvilleky.gov
502.574.5925






