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O-116-22

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett

] Amount: $6,400.00 Date: Mar7, 2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding for maintenance of Southern Parkway (N. Side} 3rd Street and NW side of Taylor Blvd
Interchanges. This inciudes a Spring and Fall clean up. Payment to Integrated Services, Inc.

City Agency: Pubic Works and Assets
Contact Person: Jeffery Brown

Agency Phone: 502-574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

15 Fn | bz $6,400.00 Mar 7, 2022
District # Cguncil Member Sigfnature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _(0-116-22 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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tnterag.e.ncy Name: Public Works
Program/Project Name: 7o Integrated Services,Inc. for maintenance/spring & fall clean up
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) -
Appropriating Funding? ~ Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? - NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the : NA
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA
'Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If 50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid :

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: shughes Date: Mar7, 2022

Revised May 2016



Hughes, Susan

A K A N S R SO N L LT
From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 10:20 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey £

Cc: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Integrated's ramp work!

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Thank you Sir!

From: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 7:22 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Integrated's ramp work!

Public Works will accept $6,400 for Integrated Services to perform spring and fall landscape maintenance at the
following I-264 interchanges:

Southern Pkwy {north side)

39 St {north west side)

Taylor Blvd

leffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director of Public Works
444 S 5™ St, 4% Floor

Louisville, KY 40202
{502)574-0065

Cell (502}773-3222
Jeffrev.Brown@louisvilieky.gov

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, March 4, 2022 12:05 PM

To: Brown, leffrey E <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Integrated's ramp work!

*EYI*

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Friday, February 25,2022 12:10 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown®@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: Integrated's ramp work!

Hi Jeff!
Here is Integrated’s cost estimate for our District 15 requested ramp work for 2022. The work will be done twice. Once
near Derby and the other in late fali. Will you/Public Works accept the funds?



INTEGRATED Services Inc.

A Full Service Facility Maintenance Company

Louisville Metro
Spring & Fall Clean-up Proposal
Attention: Dan Luckett

Date 2/15/2022

Southern Parkway North Side, 3+
St N W side & Taylor Blvd
Interchange

Spring & Fall Clean-up

Clean up existing landscape 5 $3,200.00 $6,400.00
beds. Spray weed killer in beds,

trim bushes, limb up trees, and
mulch tree rings and beds. Spray
weed killer around bridge
corners.

Please contact Kevin Downs with
any questions @ 502-413-1729
Integrated Services Inc.

PO Box 43352

Louisville, KY 40253




