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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
m Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Print Form |

CIF051122PW18

| Primary Sponsor: Marilyn Parker

| Amount: $1,250

Date: 4-19-22

Public Works.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Repair of a sidewalk located at 1917 Arboro Place classified as a hazard and rated a 4 by Metro

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Hackbart

Agency Phone: 574-8824

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

18 Wik e

$1,250 4-19-22

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF051122PW138 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Metro Public Works/1917 Arboro Place Sidewalk repair

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: 1917 Arboro Place Sidewalk repair
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes

funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

estimate and description of cost? Yes

Submitted by: Chris Lewis Date:  4-19-22

Revised May 2016



Lewis, Chris W

Subject: FW: Contact Councilwoman Marilyn Parker [#2000]

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 19, 2022 11:54 AM

To: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Marilyn Parker [#2000]

Public works will accept the funds.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 19, 2022 11:47 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Marilyn Parker [#2000]

Can you please send me an email stating that Public Works will accept the funding of $1250 to repair this sidewalk
located at 1917 Arboro Place?

Chris W. Lewis

Office of Councilwoman Marilyn Parker

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-1118

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, April 6, 2022 1:16:49 PM

To: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Contact Councilwoman Marilyn Parker [#2000]

Chris,

No | have not contacted the constituent, but | was saying that would be the gist | would give. It would be more in terms
of, “you can contact your council rep to see if they may have funding available to help expedite the request since our



backlog is still addressing concerns reported in 2018.” Do you want to contact him back or want me to reach out to
him?

In terms of a quick estimate, $1250.00 to repair.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Councilwoman Marilyn Parker <no-reply@wufoo.com>
Sent: Monday, April 4, 2022 1:38 PM

To: Lewis, Chris W <Chris.Lewis@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Contact Councilwoman Marilyn Parker [#2000]

Name Joe Richardson

Address

1917 Arboro Place
Louisville, KY 40220

United States

Phone (502) 378-2208

Number

Email joerichardson.ky@gmail.com

Comments

Dear Ms. Parker,

| submitted a request to Metro 311 for sidewalk repair well over 2 years ago. They rated the damage a 4 out of 5, and
said they would put in a work order. | have been patiently waiting for the repair. The busted sidewalk area has caused
people to trip and we have young children riding bikes over it as well. | paid over $23,000.00 in taxes to the state of
Kentucky and Louisville Metro Revenue Commission this year and this is the first time I've requested services. | would

greatly appreciate it if you could please help us with this matter.

Thank you for any assistance you can give.
Joe E. Richardson

502.378.2208





