CIF051122PW15A

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
= Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: Kevin Triplett

| Amount: $981.79 Date: Apr21, 2022

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding will be used for sidewalk repair in front of 1421 Anna Lane.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Matt Haines

Agency Phone: 502-574-3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF051122PW15A To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016

Page |



sharward
Line


Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Sidewalk Repair on Anna Ln.

Request Form: s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
- Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
* account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

j Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
~own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
. funding source is probably NDF.

| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

" Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA |

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Submitted by: shughes

Date: Apr 21, 2022

Revised May 2016
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Gmail - FW: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/7ik=2bect3331 7&view=pt&search=a...

¥ 7

FW: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate Lo

Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov> Tue, Apr 5, 2022 at 1:20 PM
To: "swhughes11@gmail.com” <swhughes11@gmail.com>

From: Luckett, Daniel R <Danjel Luckett@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent; Tuesday, April 5, 2022 11:28 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky gov>; Triplett, Kevin D. <Keavin. Triptett@louisvilleky. gov>;
Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thierry. mahanuka@lmgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Co: Hackbar, Jeff M <Jeff. Hackbart@louisvilleky gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilisky.gov>
Subject: RE: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate

Thank you!

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky. gov>

Sent: Tuesday, Aprit 5, 2022 11.27 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Lucketi@louisvilleky.gov>; Triplett, Kevin D, <Kevin. Triplstt@louisvilleky.gov>;
Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thierry. mahanuka@lmgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff Hackbart@louisvilieky gov>; Hughes, Susan <Susan.Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate

We will accept the funding.

Thank you,

fatihew K. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assels

444 South 5T Street, 41 Floor

Loulsville KY 40202

802 874 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 {C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

I of3 4/13/2022, §:19 PM
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From: Lucketi, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 11:13 AM
To: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin Triplett@louisvilleky.gov>; Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thierry.mahanuka@lmgky.

onmicrosoft.corm>
Cc: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvileky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff Hackbart@louisvilleky.govs,

Hughes, Susan <Susan Hughes@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate

Will Public Works accept the funding?

From: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin Triplett@louisvilleky gov>

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 11:11 AM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thigrry. mahanuka@imgky onmicrosoft com>

Ce: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky.gov>;
Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff Hackbart@louisvilleky gov>

Subject: Re: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate

Thank you Thierry - we'll process accordingly To appropriate Tunaing
Counciliman Triplett

District 15

From: Muhanuka, Thierry P. <thierry. mahanuka@imgky onmicrosoft.com>

Sent: Tuesday, April 5, 2022 12:01 AM

To: Triplett, Kevin D. <Kevin. Triplefi@louisvilleky gov>

Cc: Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew R <Matthew. Haines@louisvilieky.gov>;
Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff. Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: D15 - 1421 Anna Ln sidewalk repair estimate

CM Triplelt,

Below is the cost estimate to repair/replace the sidewalks in front of 1421 Anna Lane,

SR#
LOCATION 1421 Anna Ln
REQUESTED BY Counciiman Triplett
RATE 5

4/13/2022, 8:19 PM
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DATE SENT 4/5/2022
ESTIMATE BY tpm
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x14' of sw & 4'x10' of dw
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $981.78

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent.
Any requests after 120 days will require re-
inspection.

Please let me Know if you have any guestions.

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely for use by
the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are hereby notified that any
disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of this information is strictly
prohibited and may be unlawful.
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