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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
x Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: _Gindi Fowler |

[Amount: 31500 Date: 05/10/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
CIF Funding requested for a sidewalk repair at 7609 Nancy Lane that is considered a tripping

hazard.

City Agency: Metro Public Works

Contact Person: patt Haines

Agency Phone: 505 574.3883

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

14 Cingi Fowler $1500 05/10/2022
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF060122PW14 To OMB:
Budget Revision #;
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost; Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project:
Metre Public Works/Sidewalk Repair 7609 Nancy Lane

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax doliars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/PrOJect Name: Sidewalk Repair 7609 Nancy Lane

- Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of o
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
‘Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville |
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If 50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA
Supportmg Documentation: Does the attachment i1 mc]ude a valid y
es

estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: Elizabeth Alexander

Date: 05/10/2022

Revised May 2016




Alexander, Elizabeth

From: Fowler, Cindi

Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 12:15 PM
To: Alexander, Elizabeth

Subject: Fwd: 7906 Nancy Lane. A favor
Elizabeth,

| hope you are deing welll 1t's been so long since | have seen you! | miss you girl! It has been so weird the last 2
years. Anyway, can you please do me a favor? Cindy is out of town and | need $1500 transferred to public works for a
sidewalk repair at the above address by the next new business deadline on the 16th. | hate to ask you but if you can’t !

may be

able to ask Sonya. They are out there working on adjacent sidewalks and it would be a cost savings because they

are already staged. Thanks Elizabeth!! | appreciate your consideration!

Cindi

Sent fro

m my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Fowler, Cindi" <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: May 10, 2022 at 12:08:12 PM EDT

To: "Haines, Matthew R" <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: "Hackbart, Jeff M" <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>, "Brown, Jeffrey E"
<jeffrey.Brown®@louisvilleky.gov>, "Muhanuka, Thierry P."

<thierry.mahanuka@imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Subject: Re: 7906 Nancy Lane

Matt,
Thank you very much! | really appreciate it! | will have the funds in new business Monday. | really

appreciate your assistance Matt!
Cindi

Sent from my iPad

On May 10, 2022, at 12:02 PM, Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
wrote:

| have our inspectors marking it up for repair. Piease get us a CIF of $1500 to cover the
costs associated with this repair.

Jeff an Thierry - please get this onto our sidewalk repair list and get with Riverside to
have them take on this additional repair. Austin said its about 12 linear feet of sidewalk
needing to be repaired, is either a 4 or 5 rating, and that the contractor has not demoed
on the other Nancy address we have.

Thanks,




Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5th Street, 4th Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1502 574 4129 { F):

From: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Faw!er@!{auisviﬂeky,gob
Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 11:29 AM '
To: Haines, Matthew R <Matihew.Haines@loulsvilleky.gov> .

Cc: Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffre\) E
<Jeffrey Brown@louisvilleky.gov> :

Subject: Re: 7906 Nancy Lane

| realize you don’t have funding but D14 would cover the cost. Could the contractor give
you a cost while on site?

Thanks Matt
Cindi

Sent from my iPad

On May 10, 2022, at 10:25 AM, Haines, Matthew R
<Matthew.Haines@louisvillekv.gov> wrote:

We do not have funding available for the repair. it also begins getting
very confusing trying to add things last minute between engineering,
inspections, and the contractor.

Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5th Street, 4th Floor

Louisville KY 40202 . .
502 574 3883 (D) | 502 528 5973 {C) | 502 574 4129 (F)

--—-—Qriginal Message---—



From: Fowler, Cindi <Cindi.Fowler@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, May 10, 2022 10:16 AM
To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky gov>

Cc: Hackbart, leff M <jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E
<jeffrev.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: 7906 Nancy Lane

All,

Mr. Stigal that lives in 7906 Nancy lane just called and said they were
out there working on the sidewaiks next door. He has a 2 inch tripping
hazard. Is there anyway to have it added to the work order while they

are staged on-site?
| appreciate your consideration!
Cindi

Sent from my iPhone






