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NDF060122PW26

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
X Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
‘Fapital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Bk@.p_f 7~ AcKerson I
| Amount: \$ & I ‘7 o0 Date PS5 -/3-2622 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
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City Agency: =, |/, Works
Contact Person: M, 7thew Hrines
Agency Phone: 5 F.4-- 334 >

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

~ 1L #3169 08-13-2022

District # Cauncil Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #2  NDF060122PW26 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: | Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Poa‘é /'I,c/» Wor i(S
Program/Project Name: 8 reckenn dj e and Manner .Df Je «I mproveme nl
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) &
Appropriating Funding? e =

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with N A\
account numbers in the request form description? e

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of NA
the request exclude the matching fund amount? =

- Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they N N
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? 7

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the _A)/H—
funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful :
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ]\//A' :

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than Zﬂ »
$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required. =

" Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? /)/1 o
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? =5

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid [ 25
estimate and description of cost? -

Submitted by:@[]/hﬂ? Date: 05; - I ;Lz)) %

Revised May 2016



Harward, Sonza

From: Haines, Matthew R

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2022 7:49 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T

Cc: Harward, Sonya

Subject: RE: Acceptance of funds for Breckenridge Lane and Manner Dale Project

Public Works will accept the funds.
Thank you,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 {D) 1502 528 5973 (C} 1502 574 4129 {F)

From: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, May 16, 2022 9:53 AM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Acceptance of funds for Breckenridge Lane and Manner Dale Project

Mr. Haines —

Please respond to this email that Public Works will accept the funds from the 26™ District for the rebuilding of the
handrail and other work at the Breckenridge Lane and Manner Dale Drive project.

Thank you.

B Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Assistant to

Council Member Brent T. Ackerson
601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
502-574-1126
leffrey.noble@louisvilleky.gov




Fromi Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, April 27,2022 2:21 PM

To: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>;
Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Ackerson, Brent <Brent.Ackerson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: #SR-PARK-22-055492 - Accident at Manner Dale and Breckenridge

Matthew —
Thanks for this info. | will let her know.

We will move that amount from the 26™ CIF over to Public Works for this project. We also have an estimate from a
Love-It Landscaping company to redo the landscaping which was disturbed during the accident. They had previous done
the landscaping on the public easement at the corner. Is there a way to run that money through PW to pay them or do |
need to do that another way?

| appreciate your help on this.

B Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Assistant to

Council Member Brent T. Ackerson
601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
502-574-1126
jeff.noble@Ilouisvilleky.gov

From: Haines, Matthew R <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, April 27,2022 2:15 PM

To: Noble, Jeffrey T <Jeffrey.Noble@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff
M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: #SR-PARK-22-055492 - Accident at Manner Dale and Breckenridge

We cannot re-use these handrail materials since they were hit by a vehicle. The resident can keep or dispose of the
materials or we can get someone to pick them up when someone is available.

The cost for the new rail is $2,519.00.
Thanks,

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisviile Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5% Street, 4 Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1502 528 5973 {C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)



To: Brown, Jeffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Metro 311 <Metro.311@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: #SR-PARK-22-055492 - Accident at Manner Dale and Breckenridge

Jeff —

This SR# has been entered into Accela for an accident which occurred on 03/27/2022. Whatever input | made sent this
to Parks but it isn’t a Parks issue; it is a PW issue. A car took out some landscaping in place at the NE corner of Manner
Dale and Breckenridge Lane and then went on to take out an iron railing which PW has installed within the last

year. This intersection used to be in CM Kramer’s district but is now in Brent’s.

The car was stolen and there is probably no way to recover any costs involved for improvements. However, we want to
move on redoing the landscaping and rebuilding the iron railing. | know there was some discussion on how that would
be paid for when that was in the 11" District, and that it took a long time to get it done. At this time, we will pay for the
costs of rebuilding the railing and the landscaping costs from the 26™ CIF account.

Please tell me what | need to do to proceed as soon as possible.
I am sending also sending an unrelated email on another iron railing following this.

o Jeff

Jeff T. Noble

Legislative Assistant to

Council Member Brent T. Ackerson
601 W. Jefferson Street, Room 318
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
502-574-1126
jeff.noble@louisvilleky.gov
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