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CIF061522PW03

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
s Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Keisha Dorsey |

| Amount: $2475 Date: Jun 3, 2022 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,

location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
An additional speed hump on Qleanda Avenue, between 7th Street Rd and Oleanda Court and

signage.

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Greg Dow

Agency Phone: 502-574-3882

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

3 $2475 Jun 3, 2022
District # Amount - Date
Appraved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF061522PWO03 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Department/Project: Public Works
Speed hump on Oleanda Avenue between Qleanda Ct and 7th Street Rd

Additional Signatures
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will

be used for a public purpose.
Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name:  Speed hump on Oleanda Avenue between Oleanda Ct and 7th Street Rd

o Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Yes
funding source is probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful |
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. Ne. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? Ne. NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid v

es

estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: Keturah Morrow

Date: Jun 3, 2022

Revised May 2016
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From: Dow, Greg

To: Morrow, Keturah D.

Subject: RE: Statement of cost for Oleanda Avenue speed hump/signage
Date: Thursday, June 2, 2022 11:08:47 AM

Attachments: image001.png

Keturah,

Public Works and Assets will accept the funds.

Greg

From: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 2, 2022 11:07 AM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Statement of cost for Oleanda Avenue speed hump/signage

Greg,

| am going to go ahead and submit this paperwork for the speed hump on Oleanda for new business
on Monday, 6/6/22. Will you accept the funds on behalf of Public Works?

Keturah Morrow, MAOL

Legislative Assistant to Keisha Dorsey
Louisville Metro Council | District Three
601 W. Jefferson St. | Louisville, KY 40202

Email: Keturah.Morrow@I ouisvilleKY.gov
Office: 502.574-1103

From: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@]|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 27, 2022 4:30 PM

To: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Statement of cost for Oleanda Avenue speed hump/signage

Keturah,

Please see attached statement of cost for an additional speed hump and sign for Oleanda Avenue

between 7t Street Road and Oleanda Court.
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Fyi/Headsup!- We are working to get a secondary contractor online to do speed hump installation.
You can fund this at the current rate as stated on the statement of cost but | can’t provide you an
installation date based on our current contractor’s availability, or you can wait and fund this once we
get a secondary contractor in place to negotiate a cost and availability.

After negotiations with the secondary contractor, | don’t know if the cost per speed hump is going to
be less or more than what is quoted on the attached statement of cost.

Greg

From: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 10:51 AM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Oleanda

Works for us then. We can go ahead.

From: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 10:40 AM

To: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Oleanda

Keturah,

It wouldn’t hurt. Initially, | placed the existing speed humps in the current locations based on the
fatality that occurred at the park and placing another toward 7t Street would help out with

speeding coming off of 7™ Street.

Greg

From: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, May 23, 2022 10:06 AM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Oleanda

Yes, we can proceed. But, from your viewpoint, is it necessary?

From: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, May 19, 2022 11:53 AM

To: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Oleanda
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Keturah,

Do you still want to add another speed hump on Oleanda Avenue? | just spoke with Mr. Wilkins
about this.

Please advise.
Thanks!,

Greg

From: Morrow, Keturah D. <Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 9, 2021 11:52 AM

To: Dow, Greg <Greg.Dow@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Oleanda

Greg,

Kevin Wilkins called about getting another speed hump on Oleanda. Said people speed on the last
150 ft of the street, after they pass the first 4 speedhumps. His number is 502-314-6767. | know the
previous speedhumps were put down in 2018 and were split between D3, D6 & D15.

Keturah Movrow, MAOL

Legislative Assistant to Keisha Dorsey

Louisville Metro Council | Louisville Metro District Three
601 W. Jefferson St. | Louisville, KY 40202

Email: Keturah.Morrow®@I ouisvilleKY.gov

Office: 502.574-1103



mailto:Keturah.Morrow@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Greg.Dow@louisvilleky.gov
mailto:Keturah.Morrow@LouisvilleKY.gov
https://louisvilleky.gov/
http://www.crimemapping.com/alerts

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY

GREG FISCHER VANESSA D. BURNS
MAYOR Director
T Councilman Keisha Dorsey
District 3
FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: May 27, 2022
RE: Cost of additional Speed Hump/Sign for Oleanda Avenue

One (1) Speed Humps x $2,215.00= $2,215.00
One (1) Speed Hump signs x $260.00 = $260.00
Total= $2,475.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $2,215.00 and each sign is $260.00. One additional speed
hump and sign will be added between 7" Street Road and Oleanda Court. The total “not to exceed”
cost is $2,475.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed hump and sign will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW.LOUISVILLEKY.GOV
METRO DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH 5™ STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202



Add a 30" W17-1a Speed Hump

Ahead with an 18" W13-1P 15 mph ¥,
advisory speed plaque to new drive

| post at this location.

k 1 .——

Oleanda Avenue

(Between 7th Street Road and Oleanda Court)

(1) Additional Speed Hump
(1) Additional Speed hump sign

May 27, 2022






