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From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 3:14 PM

To: MetroCouncilClerk

Subject: FW: NDF - D9 - Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Metro Clerks,

D9 would like to rescind NDF032322MP09 due to the expense being covered by Metro Parks. Please
see below email for more information.

Thank you,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (5602) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 2:59 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Messina, Kristina <Kristina.Messina@louisvilleky.gov>; Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>;
Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2@louisvilleky.gov>;
Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Kyle, please inform the Clerk’s office that D9 needs to rescind NDF032322MP09 due to the expenses being covered by
Metro Parks. Please use this email for the reason. Thanks.

From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 10:39 AM

To: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>;
Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Messina, Kristina <Kristina.Messina@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>; Hollander,
Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Good morning,

| agree with Andrea. Since the event is covered by Metro Parks, D9’s NDF funds should not be accepted. Therefore,
please do not process a budget revision for the NDF032322MP09. Thank you.

From: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 9:40 AM
To: Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
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Cc: Messina, Kristina <Kristina.Messina@|louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

| already sent an email yesterday to Regina and Margaret asking about it. This is covered event and we should not accept
funds for this.

From: Dauvis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, June 9, 2022 9:38 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Messina, Kristina <Kristina.Messina@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Good Morning LaTonya,

We are awaiting approval to accept funds.
Once approved we will process.

Thank you,

Elizabeth Davis-Terhune

Budget Planning Analyst

Office of Management & Budget
Louisville Metro Government
611 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: 502-574-3568
Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 8:01 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>; Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Iouisvilleky.gov>;
Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@louisvilleky.gov>; Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>;
Messina, Kristina <Kristina.Messina@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Good evening,

At the 3/23/22 Appropriations Committee meeting, D9 appropriated $1900 but we have not received a budget revision
report to charge D9 NDF yet. If this is the same event reference below that will be paid for with Metro Parks funds, then
| recommend a budget revision report not be generated for the $1900. Please advise. Thanks.

METRO PARKS FOR THE ANNUAL
CRESCENT HILL COMMUNITY
COUNCIL FOURTH OF JuLY
CELEBRATION.

3/23/2022 NDF032322MP09 $1,900.00




From: Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 3:43 PM

To: Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Margaret,

Thanks for your email. We would love for the funds to be returned to our NDF. Should we initiate on
our end?

Thank you,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (5602) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

Click here to sign up for the bi-weekly District 9 weekly eNews, and sign up for the D9 blog for the latest neighborhood
news and alerts!

From: Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 8:21 AM

To: Hollander, Bill H. <Bill.Hollander@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Ethridge, Kyle <Kyle.Ethridge @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Importance: High

Please see below and let me know if it works for you
Margaret

From: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 8:08 AM

To: Tate, Regina L <Regina.Tate @louisvilleky.gov>; Brosko, Margaret A. <Margaret.Brosko@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: FW: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Importance: High

| show this as one of the covered events. | would think we wouldn’t accept these funds? Please advise

9 Annual Crescent Hill 4" of July July $2600 to Parks Stage and other
Celebration equipment rental

From: Davis, Elizabeth S <Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, June 8, 2022 7:57 AM

To: Veeneman, Andrea R. <Andrea.Veeneman@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: NDF — D9 — Parks — Annual Crescent Hill 4th of July Celebration

Good Morning Andrea,



Hopefully, this is the last one for a while.
Could you please provide coding for the attached?
Thank you,

Elizabeth Davis-Terhune

Budget Planning Analyst

Office of Management & Budget
Louisville Metro Government
611 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: 502-574-3568
Elizabeth.Davis2 @louisvilleky.gov




