Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
)( Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)

| Primary Sponsor: DAV A J2ung (

| Amount: ‘g@g Date: ¢ ;’!ﬁ’ j?‘?*

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
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City Agency: LUWOVille WeTPo PUbUL WOkl and RE(eTT
Contact Person: Wiiijam Hhved
Agency Phone: {hp ~ 1AL ~ (237(99‘

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be usedsfor a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the pece ngftment concerning the project/expenditure.

L2368 g/4 /93

b O

District # Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Compiletion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: Davigh Jgued DiSTyTet e { PUbLiC  woreS
- Program/Project Name: tﬂimmm Styeet Sz@n j - Wateg STop Wow

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s) o
Appropriating Funding? - (/5}5
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
~ account numbers in the request form description? — (\f\@(
' Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of ‘\[\Qf

the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they ,
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? - M VS\’

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the . g
funding source is probably NDF.

“Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

 life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. - \/K'S

“Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than -
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. o N\Q»
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? -

. If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - NH"

: Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid

. estimate and description of cost? — %/j

Submitted by:

Date: <Z l i Z G0

Revised May 2016



Taylor, Shalanna

From: Hines, William A

Sent: Thursday, August 18, 2022 10:51 AM
To: Taylor, Shalanna; Brown, Jeffrey E
Ce: James, David A; Sparks, Stuart
Subject: Re: Neighborhood banner question

Yes we will accept.

Thanks,
William

From: Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilieky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, August 18, 2022 10:47:08 AM

To: Hines, William A <William.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown, leffrey E <leffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: James, David A <David.James@louisvilieky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Neighborhoad banner question

William,

I’m ready to upload this paperwork and new resolution to Granicus. Can you confirm that your office will accept the
funds of $268?

Thank you,

Shalanna Taylor

Legislative Assistant

President David James District 6 Office

601 W. Jefferson Street Louisvilie, Ky 40202

| Office: 502-574-1106 |

| Direct: 502-574-38910

| Cell: 502-724-3684 |

Click here to subscribe to the District 6 Newsletter

From: Hines, William A <william.Hines@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, July 19, 2022 2:37 PM

To: Brown, leffrey E <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilieky.gov>; Taylor, Shalanna <Shalanna.Taylor@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: James, David A <David.James@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Sparks, Stuart <Stuart.Sparks@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Neighborhood banner question

The cost is $188 for sign and $80 for the post. Total will be $268

Thanks,



