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CIF110222PW05B

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
X Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
C W Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: DN N(C PUCUTS - DO ]
| Amount: #7(, Y5 Date: 10T [T 27 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): ‘ 5 % 7[;
3 ]4 — Yrae
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City Agency: ' ol VoY
Contact Person: T—Q}{ Brown
Agency Phone: 502 - 57 L/._, O@(Df—r

I'have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # -Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF110222PWO05B To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name: Y b\ . Wevl v o ?Q (9 b2 <. 2 7 1Tk %

Program/Project Name: > | do w ("\ g e {?A

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: [s the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
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Submitted by

N/

Date: 10/14/25’ 22

Revised May 2016



Harward, Sonya
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From: Brown, Jeffrey
Sent: Friday, October 14, 2022 8:09 AM
To: Harward, Sonya
Cc: Purvis, Donna
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Cost Estimate at 662 S 37th St

Public Works will accept funds for the sidewalk repair at 662 S 37t St.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Sent: Tuesday, October 11, 2022 2:30 PM

To: Purvis, Donna <Donna.Purvis@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair Cost Estimate at 662 S 37th St

CW Purvis,

Below is the cost estimate to repair/replace the sidewalks in front of 662 S 37th St. Please let me know if you have any
questions.

SR#
LOCATION 662 S 37th St
REQUESTED BY D-5 CW Purvis
RATE R4
DATE SENT 10/11/2022
ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 6'x10' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,645.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

Thanks,

Thierry M.

From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 10:39 AM

To: Irvin, Stella <Stella.Irvin@louisvilleky.gov>; Hackbart, Jeff M <Jeff.Hackbart@louisvilleky.gov>; Muhanuka, Thierry
<thierry.mahanuka@Imgky.onmicrosoft.com>

Cc: Purvis, Donna <Donna.Purvis@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk Repair




Stella, Jeff H & Thierry,
We should still have a record for this one. If you all can’t find the original notes please inspect and rate but use the

original request date for prioritizing.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Purvis, Donna <Donna.Purvis@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, October 7, 2022 9:46 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Fwd: Sidewalk Repair

Good Morning Jeff,
Can you have the sidewalk at the address below assessed for repair/replacement?
Thanks
Councilwoman Purvis
Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: Andrea Caldwell <andreacaldwell12 @gmail.com>
Date: October 7, 2022 at 9:35:13 AM EDT

To: "Purvis, Donna" <Donna.Purvis@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Sidewalk Repair

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe

Thank you.
662 S 37th St, Louisville, KY 40211.

Andrea Caldwell

Success is often achieved by those who don't know that failure is inevitable ~ Coco Chanel

On Fri, Oct 7, 2022, 9:33 AM Purvis, Donna <Donna.Purvis@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Good Morning,
Please send me your address.
Thanks

Councilwoman Purvis



Sent from my iPhone

On Oct 7, 2022, at 9:19 AM, Andrea Caldwell <andreacaldwell12 @gmail.com> wrote:

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not
click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender
and know the content is safe

Donna,
Good morning.

I recently read that Representative John Yarmuth is giving a S1mm grant for sidewalk
repairs.

My grandson fell and scraped his knees and legs, people walking by have tripped on
the broken sidewalk. On May 2, 2019 | sent a request to Metro 311 to repair the
sidewalk in front of my home and no one responded so | went to Twitter this week and
asked if my sidewalk could be repaired under this new grant.

I did receive a reply back from Louisville Metro 311 who stated that my request was
received May 2, 2019 which was right before they began using a new system and there
are no notes from Public Works. They requested that | contact Public Works at 502-
574-5810 which | did this morning and spoke with Becky. Unfortunately Becky was
unable to find my request from May 2019 #5275249-SRV in the new system.

A new service request was input today #SR-SDCB-22-138660. However, this request
was sent 3 years ago and | believe that it should be given some priority for

repairs. Please let me know what you think and how you may be able to assist in this
matter.

Thank you.

Have a fantastic day/|
Andrea Caldwell|
502) 310-8641 Cellphone]

Success is often achieved by those who don't know that failure is inevitable ~

[Coco Chanel

The information contained in this communication from the sender is confidential. It is intended solely
for use by the recipient and others authorized to receive it. If you are not the recipient, you are
hereby notified that any disclosure, copying, distribution or taking action in relation of the contents of
this information is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.



