MB

Print Form

CIF111622PW01

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Angela Bowens Metro Council District 1 |

[ Amount: $30468.25 Date: 11/2/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
The CIF funds requested are to be used to repave/ repair Young Ave from 32nd Street - Louis
Coleman Jr Dr . The total estimate received from Metro Public Works was $50,000.00 , $19,531.75
of the funds are coming from the accounts : 8133-410-8107-148911 -822702 ,
8133-410-8210-148911-822702 & 8102-410-8105-148911-822702 & 831 532 .

City Agency: Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 502 574 0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

1 QYQ $30,468.25 11/02/2022

District # Couficil Member Signatu_re Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #:  CIF111622PWO01 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Department/Project:
Metro Public Works Young Ave Street Paving

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Young Ave Street Paving

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested. does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

—¥es— No

—es— No

Yes

Yes

Yes

NA

No

Yes

Submitted by:
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Weathers, Chuck

— —
From: Bell, Latonya
Sent: Monday, October 31, 2022 3:36 PM
To: Weathers, Chuck
Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Bowens, Angela
Subject: FW: Sidewalk repair cost estimates at 1036 S 28th St & 2814 Greenwood Ave

Please use the below email as your supporting documentation for the $30,468.25 CIF that you will be preparing for the
Young Ave from S 32" St to Louis Coleman paving project. Please also reference the total $50k project cost and that the
$19,531.75 is coming from the below accounts. Thanks.

From: Bell, Latonya

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 8:38 AM

To: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Weathers, Chuck <Charles.Weathers@Ilouisvilleky.gov>;
Brown, leffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk repair cost estimates at 1036 S 28th St & 2814 Greenwood Ave

Matt, thank you!

Please use the below account numbers and the amounts in red font type that total $19,531.75 to assist with funding the
$50,0000.00 Young Ave from S 32" St to Louis Coleman paving project. D1 will use $30,468.25 D1 CIF funds to cover the
remaining cost of the project. Also, please add this project and its corresponding information to the Monthly Paving
Report. Again, thank you.

Project Remaining Fund
Account Number Description Budget Encumbrance Actual Budget Source
8133-410-8107- D1 Paving Metro GO
148911-822702 | Projects 20,000.60 96,046.95 $13,951.02 | gngs 17A
8133-410-8210- D1 Paving Metro GO
148911-822702 | Projects PRHAREL0 JE 13:991.02 | gongs 174
Capital-
8102-410-8105- . ;
D1 Paving -. | Council
148911-822702 & Projects 10,866.52 0 9,484.81 629.71 Infrastructure
831532 Eunds




8102-410-8105- D1 Paving 235:2:[
14891813-1852322?02& Projects 10,866.52 0 9,484.81 629.71 lifiastrictiie
Funds
Total 338,655.52 0.00 102,992.98 28,531.75

From: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 8:13 AM

To: Weathers, Chuck <Charles.Weathers@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, Latonya <LaTonya.Bell2@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Brown,
leffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk repair cost estimates at 1036 S 28th St & 2814 Greenwood Ave

Sorry, going down the line and did not see this updated request. Paving Young Ave from S 32" St to Louis Coleman will
be $55,000.00. So as long as D1 will funds the remaining, we will accept the funds.

Matthew R. Haines, PE

Engineering Supervisor

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets

444 South 5 Street, 4" Floor

Louisville KY 40202

502 574 3883 (D) 1 502 528 5973 (C) 1 502 574 4129 (F)

From: Weathers, Chuck <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 3:41 PM

To: Bell, Latonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Brown,
Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk repair cost estimates at 1036 S 28th St & 2814 Greenwood Ave

Afternoon all, | made a mistake and the actual street is Young Ave and not Southern Ave , Young Ave from 32"¢ St —
Louis Coleman Jr Dr . Sorry C Weathers

From: Bell, Latonya <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 3:16 PM

To: Weathers, Chuck <Charles.Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>; Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>;
Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk repair cost estimates at 1036 S 28th St & 2814 Greenwood Ave

Jeff or Matt, will Public Works accept D1’s $19,531.75 paving funds to assist with funding the Southern Ave between
32nd St - Louis Coleman Jr Dr street paving project?

If Public Works will accept D1’s funds for this project, how much additional funds will be needed from D1’s CIF account
to assist with funding the project?

Thank you,

LaTonya
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