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CIF120722PW21A

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
' Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
® Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
l Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Nicole George ]

| Amount: $30,000 Date: 11/23/2022 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

$20,000 +o QUIC WOILS Yo pave and formalize
e on-Street PCM’MV\ GARNG \Al ;L%Mﬁ o,
Necs Brneicanh Comn Mwmg Center.

City Agency: Pyblic Works and Assets

Contact Person: joff Brown

Agency Phone: 502.574.0085

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation froem the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

21 /l)m S Q—M $30,000 11/23/2022

District # Counm] Member Signatur Amount Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: _ CIF120722PW21A To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Interagency Name: {9 U E\QX g

C Iories, ~fresers

WO

A Wa

Program/Project Name: S\ o uldoim PCI\ \J{ l’\\i} W K@/{f\ 4

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

~Jes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

~ Nk

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

—— Nﬁ,

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

~ IV

“Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

- Yes

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

- Jes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

- #

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

~ NO

Supporting Docamentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

- Jes

Submitted byzww\,u%w Dﬁﬂ& 2? Date: “ / 23/ 20277

* Rachel Roaxx Logisiatiue i

Revised May 2016




000°0€$~ UOROINIISUOD Pajewnss ‘Yipim aue| Supyed 7 Inoge ‘Aepy poomuay m Suoje Supjied 132115-U0 By} 9zI|EULIO) pue ARy




Roarx, Rachel

From: - Brown, Jeffrey

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2022 2:32 PM

To: George, Nicole; Tudor, Michael

Ce: Roarx, Rachel; Katz, Rebecca; Emilie Dyer; King, Michael
Subject: RE: Americana requests for the area around Kenwood Way
Categories: Print, Allocate $

Public Worlks will accept funds for the shouider paving along Kenwood Way.

Jeffrey Brown, PE

Assistant Director

Metro Public Works & Assets
444 5 5th S, 4th Fl

Louisvitle, KY 40202

Office 502-574-0065

Ceil 502-773-3222
Jeffrey.Brown@ LouisvilleKY. gov

From: Brown, ieffrey <Jeffrev. Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 8:54 AM

To: George, Nicole <Nicole George @louisvilleky.gov>; Tudor, Michael <Mike. Tudor@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca <rebecca katz@louisvilleky.sov>; Emilie Dyer
<gmille@americanace.org> : '
Subject: Americana requests for the area around Kenwood Way

I've directed the sign shop to install Truck prohibition signs at the Southside & W Kenwood intersection and the S 1% 5t &
Woodlawn Ave intersection to deter trucks from using the area for parking, sorry | don’t have an installation date set
yet. '

Attached are a few options that may help deter the truck parking.
All of the roads within Douglas Park are private so we couldn’t require a vehicular connection to £ Kenwood Way but it is
something we would consider if the property owners/managers wanted to apply for a permit to complete the

connection. This would require some road construction though which would be the responsibility of the permittee.

Barricading the end of the road to prevent truck access, with or without the formal road closure, couid be an option as
long as the church does not need to use that area for access to their property.

%,We estimate the cost to pave the shoulder along W Kenwood to accommodate parking would be about $30, OOO This
section of road was paved in 2017 S0 it will be a while until it's up again for paving. :

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: George, Nicole <Nicole.George @louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 5:25 PM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrev.Brown@iocuisvilleky.gov>; Tudor, Michael <Mike. Tudor@louisvilleky gov>
1 .




Cc: Roarx, Rachel <Rachel.Roarx@iouisvilieky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca <rebecca katz@louisvilieky.gov>; Emilie Dyer

<gmilie@americanacc.org>
Subject: RE: NEW PARC Director

leff & Mike,

Thanks again for meeting us yesterday to discuss parking solutions for Americana Community Center and the Southside
Neighborhood. Below are the discussion items and act:on steps | collected. Please feel free to make corrections or

additions.

e Points of understanding:

v' Jeff clarified that the property running alongside Kenwood Way is right-of -way. No one is permitted to park
there unless it is concreted or covered with asphalt. Pulling out onto the roadway could drag gravel on to
the street.

v" PARC does their best to equitably enforce i.e. they will cite every vehicle they see in the nght of way Per
Gloria the semis are being ticketed but disregard enforcement.

s Action items:

Mike will research the history of citations.

Short term No Truck parking signs could be added.

Option #1- Americana could request a permit to pave the area.

Option #2- The street could possibly be widened if aligned with the paving schedule.

ANENENRN

Additional:

Consider right of way closure at Kenwood Ct or opening the roadway

leff will research the closure of Kenwood Way and pedestrian connectlons
Jeff will research street lighting options.

Emilie will research mowing agreement along right of way.

ASRNENEY

From: Katz, Rebecca <rebecca katz@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, October 17, 2022 2:08 PM

To: Tudor, Michael <Mike. Tudor@louisvilleky.gov>; George, N|cole <Nrcoie George@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Roarx, Rachel <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.govs o

Subject: RE: NEW PARC Director

Good afternoon all,

Director Tudor, congratulations on your new appointment! We look forward to working with you. We invite you to join a
meeting with our office, Jeff Brown, and Americana Community Center’s Executive Director Emilie Dyer to help us solve
parking issues along West Kenwood Way that inspire health and safety. Would any of the following times work for you?

Tuesday, 10/25 at 1p
Monday, 10/31 at 1p
Thursday, 11/3 at 11a

Very gratefully,
Rebecca




Roarx, Rachel

From: George, Nicole

Sent; - Wednesday, Novemnber 23, 2022 2:21 PM

To: ~ Brown, Jeffrey; Tudor, Michae!

Ce: Roarx, Rachel; Katz, Rebecca; Emilie Dyer; King, Michael
Subject: _ RE: Americana requests for the area around Kenwood Way
Foilow Up Flag: - Follow up

Flag Status: " Completed

Categories: . Print, Allocate $

Jeff- Will you accept $30,000 from D21 to pave the shoulder?

Emiiie- We can use our Council Office funding if this provides on street parking, and we produce a plan to reduce semi
storage at the end.

Can we meet next week to discuss the options Jeff present‘-’ As an FY1, I'm still waiting on an update on the Southside re-
use project. ‘

From: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, November 3, 2022 8:54 AM

To: George, Nicole <Nicole.George@louisvilleky.gov>; Tudor, Michael <Mike. Tudor@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel <Rachel.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca <rebecca. katz@louuswlleky gov>; Emilie Dyer

<emilie@americanacc.org>
Subject: Americana requests for the area around Kenwood Way

Fve directed the sign shop to install Truck prohibition signs at the Southside & W Kenwood intersection and the S 1 5t & _
Woodlawn Ave intersection to deter trucks from using the area for parking, sorry | don’t have an installation dateset . -

Attached are a few options that may help deter the truck parking. - -

All of the roads within Douglas Park are private so we couldn’t require a vehicular connection to E Kenwood Way but it is
something we would consider if the property owners/managers wanted to apply for a permit to complete the
connection. This would require some road construction though which would be the responsibility of the permittee.

Barricading the end of the road to prevent truck access, with or without the formal road closure, could be an optlon as
long as the church does not need to use that area for access to their property. :

We estimate the cost to pave the shoulder along W Kenwood to accommodate parking would be about $30 000. Thls _
section of road was paved in 2017 so lt wull be a wh:le untti |t 5 up agam for pavmg S

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From George Nicole <Nicole. George@iouasvsﬂekv gov>

Sent: Wednesday, October 26, 2022 5:25 PM

To: Brown, leffrey <leffrey. Brown®@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Tudor, Michael <Mike.Tudnr@louisvilleky gov>

Cc: Roarx, Rachel <Rache|.Roarx@louisvilleky.gov>; Katz, Rebecca <rebecca katz@louisvilleky.gov>; Emilie Dyer






