Print Form 3

CIF032323PW18
(as amended)

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
= Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Marilyn Parker, Metro Council District 18 |

[Amount: $16:860-60 $5,029.40 Date: 2~ P23 l

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
A sidewalk extension with an ADA compliant ramp constructed from the existing sidewalk to the

street at Moser Road & Florian Road. The total cost is $10,000. The remaining $4,970.60
will come from District 18’s Fee in Lieu of Sidewalk Account.

City Agency: Metro Public Works

Contact Person: gteve Kurowsky

Agency Phone: 502.574.8743

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
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District # Council My{mber Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF032323PW18 To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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NDF, CIF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Moser Road sidewalk extension with an ADA compliant ramp.

, ; ; : ; Ves/No/NA
Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes I__:]
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA B
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA B
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA B

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the Ve
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No

B

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

T

Yes

() (0 4.
Submitted by: gé(/ﬂ’//q/éw gmﬁ%,ﬂ 5 Date: }”9( 93/
(

Revised May 2016



Luckett, Daniel

Subject: FW: Sidewalk extension to Moser Road at Florian Road

From: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 9:42 AM

To: Luckett, Daniel <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: Sidewalk extension to Moser Road at Florian Road

Daniel,
Please round down to $10,000 even.

Yes, Public Works will accept the funds.

From: Luckett, Daniel <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, February 20, 2023 9:39 AM

To: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Sidewalk extension to Moser Road at Florian Road

Good morning Mr. Kurowsky!

Councilwoman Parker does want to fund this sidewalk extension with ADA compliant ramp at your estimate below of

$10,071.00. Wil you/Public Works except the funds?

From: Kurowsky, Steve <steve.kurowsky@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, February 15, 2023 6:22 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Sidewalk extension to Moser Road

Dan,

Please find below the estimate for the ADA sidewalk connection at Moser & Florian. | tried to use what | think will my
2023 pricing. This would be $10,000. My New Sidewalk Contract is currently on Bon Fire for bidding. |also attached a

drawing that | started the first time | was asked about this connection.

Sub Tota!:

Contingencies 52,014
Design

RIW

Water Line Relocation

Grand Totai:
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