Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $ ’]ISOO, 6o Date: Mari l_’; 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

NDF to Metro Parks for the Beargrass Creek trail connection project. These funds
will be used to fund the conceptual plan to connect the missing link of Beargrass
Creek Trail between Waterfront Park and Cherokee Road, creating a continuous
off-street path. Army Corps of Engineers has agreed to pay for half of this total
project cost, which is $150,000.

City Agency:  Metro Parks

Contact Person: Lisa Hite

Agency Phone: 456-8138

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Department/Project:

Metro Parks/Beargrass Creek Trail Project
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__ NDFORCIFINTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Beargrass Creek Trail Project

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description? n/ a
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount? n/a
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description? n/a
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. n/a
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF. n/ a
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

No
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Hite, Lisa

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 5:58 PM

To: Webster, Andrea M, Ethridge, Kyle; Koetter, Maria C; Noll, Mark D
Cc: Canuel, Jason T; Babb, Jade R.

Subject: RE: Beargrass Creek

Kyle,

Parks will accept these funds. And thanks to all the council members for their support of the project!

I am copying Jason and Jade so they know that there will be funds coming. This is for the Beargrass Creek Trail project
for which we have the $37,500 check from the Jones. Now these funds will be added to that and eventually transferred
to Army Corps who will manage the project.

Lisa

From: Webster, Andrea M

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 11:07 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Koetter, Maria C; Hite, Lisa; Noll, Mark D
Subject: RE: Beargrass Creek

Great news! Please pass on our sincere appreciation.

Kind regards,
Andrea

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 8:21 AM

To: Koetter, Maria C; Webster, Andrea M; Hite, Lisa; Noll, Mark D
Subject: Beargrass Creek

Good Morning,
Councilmembers Hollander, Owen and Tandy have all committed to $2,500, for a total of $7,500.
I need an email from Parks stating they will accept these funds, so we can process.

Thank you,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Tina Ward-Pugh
601 W Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-3908 office

(502) 333-4644 cell

(502) 574-7844 fax

http://districtOnews.wordpress.com/




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Webster, Andrea M

Sent: Thursday, March 12, 2015 9:13 AM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: for the newsletter

Hi Kyle —if it's not too late, Brandon made some changes to the blurb last night. This should be our final version:

Metro Parks, on behalf of the Beargrass Creek Trail Committee (a community group made up of
representatives from the Office of Sustainability, UofL, Kentucky Waterways Alliance, the Beargrass Creek
Alliance, Bicycling for Louisville, Get Outdoors KY, Waterfront Development Corporation, Botanica and MSD) is
seeking contributions to fund a conceptual plan to connect the missing link of the Beargrass Creek Trail
between Waterfront Park and Cherokee Park, creating a continuous off-street path connecting two of
Louisville’s most significant recreational assets. The project would also include an evaluation of strategies to
improve water quality and wildlife habitat along Beargrass Creek. Metro Parks has received a pledge of
$75,000 in funding from the Army Corps of Engineers to start the planning stage of the project; however, the
funding requires $75,000 in matching funds from the community. $37,500 — 50% of our goal — has been
obtained so far. But we need your help! Your donation of $100, $1,000, $2,500, or any amount would help
Metro Parks attain the $37,500 still needed. The fundraising deadline is April 10'". Please send your tax
deductible contributions to: Metro Parks (Attn: Lisa Hite), P.O. Box 37280, Louisville, KY 40233-7280. If you
have any questions, please contact Andrea Webster in the Office of Sustainability, at (502) 574-6285.

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, March 12, 2015 9:00 AM
To: Webster, Andrea M

Cc: Koetter, Maria C

Subject: RE: for the newsletter

Great, thank you!

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Bill Hollander
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-3908 office
(502) 333-4644 cell

From: Webster, Andrea M

Sent: Wednesday, March 11, 2015 5:15 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Koetter, Maria C

Subject: for the newsletter

Hi Kyle,

Here’s the blurb for your newsletter. I'll be in touch with general talking points, soon.



