Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

. Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
| | Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

I Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $6.500.00 Date: March 10, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

CIF grant to MPW for additional funds needed to construct two traffic circles on
Nanz at lola and Macon. Additional funds provided by MPW.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Dirk Gowin

Agency Phone:  574-5925

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

i W f’ ' é/MZ/\ $6,500.00 March 10; 2015

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Mmw.

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
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Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: ; Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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_ NDFOR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Traffic circles on Nanz at lola and Macon

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: [s the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the %
request form description? ) es
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching /
fund amount? nia
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in /
the request form description? | n/a
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building | Y
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. es
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If Y
not, the funding source is probably NDF. €es
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

No

| lr)frepra‘réd rby‘ :

Effective October 2013




Eth ridg_e, Kyle

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 4:33 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: RE: Nanz Traffic Circles

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Can we split 50/507
Dok L. Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 10:35 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk L

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: RE: Nanz Traffic Circles

Dirk,

Why aren't bike funds available anymore? Can MPW give any funds towards the additional $13,0007?

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Bill Hollander
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

(502) 574-3908 office

(502) 333-4644 cell

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Tuesday, March 03, 2015 9:35 AM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: RE: Nanz Traffic Circles

Kyle,

Is this funding still available, we can use it?
Dirk L. Gowin, PE, PLS, P7OE

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 9:45 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk L

Cc: Ward-Pugh, Tina

Subject: RE: Nanz Traffic Circles



Thanks Dirk
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Tina Ward-Pugh
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

(502) 574-3908 office

(502) 333-4644 cell

(502) 574-7844 fax
http://district9news.wordpress.com/

;ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 9:26 AM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Ward-Pugh, Tina

Subject: RE: Nanz Traffic Circles

Kyle,
That is correct.

Dirk L. Gowin, PE, PLS, PTOE
{502) 574-5925

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Monday, October 20, 2014 9:18 AM
To: Gowin, Dirk L

Cc: Ward-Pugh, Tina

Subject: Nanz Traffic Circles

Dirk,

| received your phone message this morning. Just wanted to confirm you no longer needed additional $13,000 for the
traffic circles on Nanz because you are using bike improvement funds.

Thanks,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilwoman Tina Ward-Pugh
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202

(502) 574-3908 office

(502) 333-4644 cell

(502) 574-7844 fax
http://district9news wordpress.com/

ﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail



