eighborhood Development Fund

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Capital Infrastructure Fund
[] Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Councilman David Tandy

| Amount: 5,000 Date: March 12, 2015

to introduce the organization to the community.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): Districts 2-6 and district 15 is -
appropriating funding to Louisville Forward to help cover the cost of the welcome reception for the'81°
regional conference of Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority. This welcome reception is open to the general public

City Agency; Louisville Forward
Contact Person: Rebecca Fleischaker

Agency Phone: 574.4042

Location of project/program: Welcome Reception for Alpha Kappa Alpha

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the

funds will be used for a public purpose.
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_4 __$2500___ 3/31/2015___
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2013
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Helton, Jessamyn

From: Yates, Matt T

Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 12:05 PM

To: King, Keidra

Cc: Helton, Jessamyn; Fleischaker, Rebecca
Subject: RE: Interagency exchange for AKA reception

Yes. This will be through Economic Development.
Thank you,

Matt Yates
Fiscal Manager
(502) 574-3730

Louisville Metro Office of Management & Budget
609 W. Jefferson Street, 3™ Floor
Louisville, KY 40202

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Monday, April 13, 2015 11:56 AM

To: Yates, Matt T

Cc: Helton, Jessamyn

Subject: RE: Interagency exchange for AKA reception

Hello Matt,
After further discussion with the organization the amount has been changed to 5, 000. Can you please confirm
that you will accept the $5K instead of the $20k originally requested. Please respond all.

Yours in Service,

Keidra D.C. King

Metro Council District Four
Councilman David Tandy
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Office: 502.574.1104

Vi

*All meeting and public appearance request should be sent to District4@louisvilleky.qov *

From: Yates, Matt T

Sent: Wednesday, February 04, 2015 2:32 PM

To: King, Keidra

Subject: RE: Interagency exchange for AKA reception



Louisville Forward will accept the funding.

From: King, Keidra

Sent: Tuesday, January 13, 2015 1:15 PM

To: Yates, Matt T

Subject: Interagency exchange for AKA reception

Hi Matt,

| hope you had a wonder new year! I'm reaching because Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority, Inc. is hosting their 81%
regional conference in Louisville in April. They have reached out to office for support for their opening reception
thatis free and open to the public. They are requesting $20,0000 from the Metro Council. Councilman Tandy
will be the lead however, there are a number of other offices who are going to come on board for support. We
were hoping to do an interagency exchange from metro council to Louisville forward. The funding will go to pay
for the rental space for the reception, audio sound and technical equipment, printing cost, food and
entertainment. Please let me know if Louisville Forward will accept the funding for this reception.

Thanks in advance for your assistances.
Yours in Service,

Keidra D.C. King

Metro Council District Four
Councilman David Tandy
601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
Office: 502.574.1104

*All meeting and public appearance request should be sent to Districtd@/ouisvilleky.qgov *




LOUISVILLE METRO COUNCIL

MARY C. WOOLRIDGE
DISTRICT 3 COUNCILWOMAN

mary.woolridge@louisvilleky.gov

DONNA B. SANDERS
LEGISLATIVE ASSISTANT

donna.sanders@louisvilleky.gov

TO: David Tandy
President Metro Council y

FROM: Councilwoman Mary C. Woolridge//m

District 3
DATE: March 12, 2015
RE: Alpha Kappa Alpha NDF
President Tandy, you should be informed that my daughter-in-law,
Erica Woolridge is a member of the Alpha Kappa Alpha Sorority and
that | have signed the NDF application for the Alpha Kappa Alpha
Sorority to appropriate $500 from the District 3 Neighborhood

Development Fund.

Should you have any questions or concerns, please do not hesitate
to contact me.

601 WEST JEFFERSON STREET 502.574.1103 FAX 502.574.3504 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202



NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
Interagency Name Lomsvﬂle forward
Program/Pro;ect Name AKA welcome receptlon
| B Yes/N o/NA
' Request Form Is the NDF Request S1gned by all Councnl Member(s) Appropnatmg Fundmg‘? yes
Request Form: If matehmg funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
 request form description? - o
Request Form: If matchmg funds are to be used does the amount of the request exclude the matchmg .
fund amount? ) - ;: B
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers i in
the request form deg:rlPtlgil‘? hd
Fundmg Source: If CIF is bemg requested does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate bu1ld1ng
05' “equipment? | If not, the funding source is probably NDF. na
| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested does the project have a useful life of more than one year'? If .
 not, the funding source is probably NDF. - n
Ordinance Reqmred Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5 000‘? No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount gwen for
the f' scal !ee{§2_5_000 or Iess‘? B B no
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Effective October 2013



