Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

|| Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
. Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

{ Primary Sponsor: Councilman Bill Hollander |

‘ Amount: $1,865.00 Date: April 28, 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to MPW for three extensions of sidewalk along Nanz Avenue. This will help
connect the existing sidewalk to the street for easier pedestrian access.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works

Contact Person: Dirk Gowin

Agency Phone: 574-5925

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

/[ g"{’/{ W $1,865.00 April 28, 2015

District#  Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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_ NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST |

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Sidewalk connectivity along Nanz Avenue

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding?

Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the

request form description? n/a
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching /
fund amount? n/a
Request Form: [f other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in

the request form description? n/a
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building

or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If Y
not, the funding source is probably NDF. es
Ordinance Required: Isthe NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? No

Ordinance Required: TIs the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

No
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Ethridge, Kyle

From: Gowin, Dirk L

Sent: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 3:00 PM

To: Hollander, Bill H.

Cc: Ethridge, Kyle

Subject: FW: Sidewalk Connections along Nanz fﬁ’j !

Looks like a total of $1,865 for the three extensions of the sidewalk. O lc ﬁg
Dirk 4. Gouin, PE, PLS, PTOE w

From: Deborah Brough [mailto:dbrough@sevensc.net]
Sent: Tuesday, April 28, 2015 2:28 PM

To: Gowin, Dirk L

Cc: Soran Walker

Subject: Sidewalk Connections along Nanz

Dirk,

Here are the adds for Nanz project per your drawings. 4" Historic 14.67 SY @ $76.80
per SY for a total of $1,126.65. Dectable Pavers @ $30.72 per SF and price TBD. Pricing
is piggy backed from Metro annual contract. Also, Soran wanted me to let you know that
we also do not have our permits for Nanz. So, hopefully we will get those soon. Please
advise.

Thank you,

Deborah Brough
Office Manager
Seven Seas Construction
P:502-231-7395
F: 502-409-9582



