Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
| | Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

I Primary Sponsor: Councilwoman Jessica Green District 1

I Amount: $2,300.00

Date: May 11,2015 |

project/program and any external grantee(s):

countless numbers of children in the area.

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of

Funding to be used for a Community event to be held on May 30th ,2015 @
Southwick Community Center and Russell Lee Park @ 3621 Southern Ave . The
event will include Health screenings provided by James Graham Brown Cancer
Center ,family activities such as bouncy houses and face painting for the kids.
During the event Councilwoman Green would like to salute Mr Samuel " Sammy "
Moore for 45 years of service to the community and his dedication to mentoring

City Agency:  Metro Parks

Contact Person: Marty Storch

Agency Phone: 002 456-8100

I have reviewed this request for an ex
will be used for a public purpose.

iture of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

1 $2,300.00 05/11/2015
District # ncil Member Signature &/ Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Budget Revision #:

Amended Amount:

To OMB:

Account #;

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2013
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NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

| Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Southwick Community Center Health fair

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? YES
Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the NA
request fom}_fiescription? i
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching NA
 fund amount? B -
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in NA
the request form description? ,
| Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building i NA
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.
' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If NA
not, the funding source is probably NDF. |
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,000? | NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less? - o - -
—
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Prepared by: ~ Charles Weathers D Date:
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Effective October 2013



Weathers, Charles

o e = o
From: Slaton, Mike
Sent: Friday, May 08, 2015 2:38 PM
To: Denise Bentley; Weathers, Charles; Storch, Marty; Richards, Robyn
Cc: Babb, Jade R.
Subject: RE: ROUGH estimate on Russell Lee event

$2500 was based on a similar recent event. That event included a stage though, as well as someone on site to manage,
which this one won’t need

If you’ve already got bouncies and DJ’s lined up, then it should be safe to assume we can use those plus a small
administrative fee to the production company

Entertainment (BJ and bouncies) $575.00
Administrative Fee - $100 (?)

2 port a pots -$125

20 picnic tables $255

20 trash cans $255

1 patchbox $106.25

Permit- $212.50

You mentioned face painting in your voice mail. Is that something you have someone for, or do we
need to find someone to do it?

Robyn is working on locating a food vendor. Is it still okay to provide free food with NDF money?
Subtotal - $1628.75... | would recommend that you appropriate $2000 - $2500 to cover listed costs

plus food, face painting, and in case we’ve missed something,. We can always return the funds that
are not spent or are not needed due to parks waiving costs. I'm sure we'll waive some of them.

Mike H. Slaton
Iroquois Amphitheater & Rental Office Manager

1080 Amphitheater Road, Louisville, KY 40214

0 502.368.5869 / F 502.368.5955 / E mike.slaton(@lowsvilleky.gov
Connect with us online: Blog, Facebook, Twitter, Flickr
www.metro-parks.org

From: Denise Bentley [mailto:denisebentley37@yahoo.com]

Sent: Friday, May 08, 2015 12:59 PM

To: Slaton, Mike; Weathers, Charles; Storch, Marty; Richards, Robyn
Subject: Re: ROUGH estimate on Russell Lee event

Mike,
We are confused...based upon our conversation this morning. We have a Bounce Co. and
DJ available with an agreed price of $575.00. It was our understanding that Production

Simple would charge a fee to be the (pass thru) to pay these to vendors. As for the food
d



vendor, they would set and pay whatever Parks charges (at no cost to us). The question
raised was will that vendor be willing to give out and prepare the free hot dogs. If the food
vendor does not agree with that set up we will grill the hot dogs ourselves. Our goal is to
have a great community event on a frugal budget. I understand the Parks charges for tables
etc... but not understanding the $2500 charge. Please explain, thanks.

I know you explained that you are not the decision maker on what charges Parks can
absorb for this event but we still need to know what to include or exclude in our budget.

In addition, I left you a voice mail in regards to face painting for the youth.

Thank you for your time and hopefully we can resolve this today.

If you can't change the people around you, change the people around you.
Have a positive day!

Denise Bentley

From: "Slaton, Mike" <Mike.Slaton@louisvilleky.gov>

To: Denise Bentley <denisebentley37@yahoo.com>; "Weathers, Charles" <Charles Weathers@louisvilleky.gov>; "Storch,
Marty" <Marty. Storch@louisvilleky.gov>; "Richards, Robyn" <Robyn.Richards@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 8, 2015 11:09 AM

Subject: ROUGH estimate on Russell Lee event

3 inflatables
1DJ
$2500 to Production Simple

2 port a pots -$125
20 picnic tables $255
20 trash cans $255

1 patchbox $106.25
Permit- $212.50

$3453.75 plus payment to vendor for food. If we figure that at $500 then our max cost is $4000

I'll narrow.down numbers as quick as | can
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B]:east Ccer cremn "
IVIAMMOGRAMS

FOR WOMEN 40 YEARS AND OVER

No cost to program eligible women without insurance

Southwick Community Center

3621 Southern Avenue
Supported by:

Councilwoman Jessica Green, District 1

Saturday, May 30, 2015
8:30am - 3:30pm

Call Denise @ 574-1101

to schedule an appointment

Mammography by James Graham Brown Cancer Center

If you have Insurance, Medicare or Medicaid, OLTRD
U of L Hospital will bill that agency.



Helton, Jessamyn

g ST
From: Green, Jessica
Sent: Monday, May 11, 2015 4:00 PM
To: Helton, Jessamyn
Cc: Weathers, Charles
Subject: RE: Appropriations Signature Approval

He has authority for that as well.

Jessica

From: Helton, Jessamyn

Sent: Monday, May 11, 2015 3:32 PM

To: Green, Jessica

Cc: Weathers, Charles

Subject: RE: Appropriations Signature Approval

What about the NDF to Public Works for the street signs?

Jess Helton

Info Systems Coordinator/Assistant Clerk Louisville Metro Council
601 West Jefferson Street, 1st Floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone - 502-574-2704

Fax - 502-574-3363

email -jessamyn.helton@louisvilleky.gov

For your convenience the Metro Council Clerk’s Office has a website! Click on this link
http://www.louisvilleky.gov/MetroCouncil/Clerk/ to access Metro Government Approved Ordinances and Resolutions,
Council and Committee Agendas, Metro Code of Ordinances and more.

From: Green, Jessica

Sent: Monday, May 11, 2015 3:26 PM

To: Helton, Jessamyn

Cc: Weathers, Charles

Subject: RE: Appropriations Signature Approval

Charles has authority to sigh my signature on the NDF to Metro Metro Parks.
Thanks!

Jessica Green

From: Helton, Jessamyn

Sent: Monday, May 11, 2015 3:20 PM

To: Green, Jessica

Cc: Weathers, Charles

Subject: Appropriations Signature Approval



CW Green,

Charles signed an appropriation request for NDF funds to Metro Parks for a community event at Southwick Community
Center and Russell Lee Park and a request for NDF funds to Public Works for honorary street signs for Samuel Moore. |
need an email from you giving him authorization to sign on your behalf. You may respond to this email with your
approval for him to sign on your behalf. '

Thank you,

Jess

Jess Helton

Info Systems Coordinator/Assistant Clerk Louisville Metro Council

601 West Jefferson Street, 1st Floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Phone - 502-574-2704

Fax - 502-574-3363

email -jessamyn.helton@louisvilleky.gov<mailto:jessamyn.helton@louisvilleky.gov>

For your convenience the Metro Council Clerk’s Office has a website! Click on this link
http://www.louisvilleky.gov/MetroCouncil/Clerk/ to access Metro Government Approved Ordinances and Resolutions,
Council and Committee Agendas, Metro Code of Ordinances and more.




