Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

] Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[ cCapital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: David A. James |

| Amount: $57,561.68 Date: July , 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):
MAP and MAP match funding for the following sidewalk projects in D6:

1140 Garvir"l Gate (SR#4470226- $43,259.04)
104 E. Magnoclia (SR# 4103074- $33,989.28)
1st & Oak Northwest Comer ($37,874.88)

Funding Source:
D6 MAP $57,561.68
D& MAP Match $ 57,561.68

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 502- 574-6789

I have reviewed this reques BX ifge tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a pub Se: v/

6 $57,561.68. July 8,2015

District # Amount Date

[

Approved by: July , 2015
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount;

Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #: -

Account #;

To Project Manager: Completion Date:

Actual Cost: ~ Funds Returned:
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Smith, Wanda M

From: Rivers, Arnitra N
Sent: Wednesday, June 10, 2015 9:37 AM
To: Smith, Wanda M
Subject: RE: Estimates for District 6
1. SR#4470226
2. $33,989.28
3. $37,874.88
4, SR# 4470484
5. SR# 4470504
6. Regarding the alleys, is Councilman lames needing estimates for paving these?

From: Smith, Wanda M

Sent: Tuesday, June 09, 2015 2:44 PM
To: Rivers, Arnitra N

Cc: James, David A

Subject: Estimates for District 6
Importance: High

Please find listed below the Estimates for District 6, CM James would like to have done. Thank you.

1. *Genscapes (new location) — 1140 Garvin Gate — Sidewalks — PLEASE NOTE: We will also be looking at the New
type of lighting in the alley behind and parallel to this location.

104 E. Magnolia - Sidewalk

1* & Oak — Northwest Corner — Sidewalk

Brook Street and Oak Street {in front of the apartment is a gaping hole)- Sidewalk

*{714 Creel Avenue and behind 731 Algonquin Parkway — Alley

1331 So. 26" Street — Alley behind this address

DU AW

| have tried to put the estimates in an orderly form. The one that have the * by them are urgent to CM James. How
soon can we expect the estimates. We need them ASAP, sorry. Thanks for all that you do.

€%

Wanda Mitchell-Smith
Legislative Assistant

District 6

David A. James, Councilman
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1106
Wanda.smith@louisvilleky.gov

This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged.
Unless you are the intended recipient (or authorized to receive this message
for the intended recipient), you may not use, copy, disseminate or disclose to
anyone the message or any information contained in the message. If you have
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Smith, Wanda M

From: Akridge, John L

Sent: Wednesday, February 11, 2015 10:06 AM
To: James, David A; Smith, Wanda M

Cc: Allen, Craig L, Rivers, Arnitra N

Subject: 104 E Magnolia Estimate

Councilman James / Wanda

Here is the estimate for 104 E Magnolia Ave as requested. The measurements look large because it will repair from 1%
St. to the alley to the east. There isn’t really a go place to stop in between due to all the cracking. If you have any
questions about the estimate feel free to contact me. If you would like to proceed with repairs Craig Allen Will be your
project manager,

SR 4103074
LOCATION 104 E Magnolia
REQUESTED BY - D6

RATE 4

DATE SENT ©2/11/2014
ESTIMATE BY J. Akridge

186x11.3 sw, 12x6 sw, 12x11.3 ramp,
10x11.3 ramp, 46 sf ADA tiles, 20 If header

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS curb, 1 tn asphalt, & contingency.
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $33,989.28
Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will

require re-inspection.

John L. Akridge

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Inspector Supervisor

3515 Newburg Road

Louisville Ky, 40218

C: 502-301-0250



Smith, Wanda M

From: Akridge, John L

Sent: Tuesday, June 16, 2015 12:51 PM
To: James, David A; Smith, Wanda M
Cc Rivers, Arnitra N; Allen, Craig L
Subject: 1140 Garvin Place

Councilman James / Wanda

Here is the estimate as requested for Garvin Place. If you have any questions about the estimate please feel free to
contact me. If you would like to proceed with repairs Craig Allen will be your project manager.

sr | 4470226 ' o k18 >
LOCATION " 1140 Garvin Place 6{1,

REQUESTED BY : D6

RATE

DATE SENT 6/16/2015

ESTIMATE BY J. Akridge

16x12 sw, 28x12 sw, 120x12sw, 36x12
dw, adjust 3 utility covers, 24 SF
ADA pavers, 150 LF Historic Header
measuremenTs/comments | Curb, & Contingency.

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $43,259.04
Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will

require re-inspection.

John L. Akridge

Louisville Metro Public Works & Assets
Inspector Supervisor

3515 Newburg Road

Louisville Ky, 40218

C: 502-301-0250



