Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request £

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
' | Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre |

| Amount: $1,000.44 Date: 18 June 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):
Through the Department of Public Works for the sidewalk repair located at 851
Fetter Ave.
Funding

MAP 8672 410 8106 048210 822702 $1,000.44

MAP Match 8676 410 8106 048210 822702 $1,000.44

City Agency: Pyblic Works
Contact Person: Criag Allen
Agency Phone; 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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Peers, Carrie G

From: Allen, Craig L

Sent: Thursday, January 22, 2015 8:47 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G

Cc: Rivers, Arnitra N; Sullivan, Leonard
Subject: FW: Estimate for D-10

LCarrie,

Please see the estimate for 851 Fetter Ave sidewalk repair below. If the new council representative chooses to go through with this repair please have these
funds appropriated and let me know.

Thanks,

Engineer |

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5™ Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Office. (502) 574-6159

Fax. (502) 574-4129

From: Sullivan, Leonard

Sent: Thursday, January 22, 2015 8:43 AM
To: Rivers, Amitra N

Cc: Allen, Craig L

Subject: Estimate for D-10

SRt 4268132

LOCATION 851 Fetter Ave,

REQUESTED BY ' D-10




RATE 485
DATE SENT 1/22/2015
ESTIMATE BY LS

S/W-11°x5' & D/W-10'x10', W/ 48" tree.

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS | Must Consult Mark White before n:&:@.l

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,000.88

sent.

Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
Any requests after 90 days will
require re-inspection.

Leonard Sullivan
Inspector Supervisor
3515 Newburg Rd.
Louisville, Ky. 40218
Cell: (502) 457-8891




