Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
. Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
. Muni;:ipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: MARIANNE BUTLER |

| Amount: $1,166.00 Date; JUNE 25, 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

The Department of Solid Waste Management will receive $1,166.00 for two metal
trash receptacles to be instalied in the Lucky Horseshoe Neighborhood. These
cans will curb litter proliferation and add an element of ownership for the
residents.

City Agency:  SOLD WASTE MANAGEMENT
Contact Person: STEVE FENSTER

Agency Phone: 502-574-8116

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

15 $1,166.00 JUNE 25, 20&
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Appreoved by:
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Luckett, Daniel R
L

From; Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Thursday, June 25, 2015 9:44 AM
To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations
Yes

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G L.TE smartphone

-------- Original message --------

From: "Luckett, Daniel R"

Date:06/25/2015 9:38 AM (GMT-05:00)
To: "Fenster, Steve A"

Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations

Mr. Fenster,
is the cost of the trash containers still $583.00 each?

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2015 2:57 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R

Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations

Nope. Got ya covered on liners.

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2015 2:55 PM

To: Fenster, Steve A

Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations

Thank you Sir! | will let you know if P.W. allows. If so we will be ordering 2 more cans for “LUCKY HORSESHOE NEIGHBORHOOD”
Those will require pads, however we are working on those. Will we need to order additional liners?

From: Fenster, Steve A

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2015 2:41 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R; Akridge, John L
Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations

Both are acceptable

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2015 11:39 AM
To: Akridge, John L

Cc: Fenster, Steve A

Subject: 2 additional trash can locations

Hi John!
The Lucky Horseshoe Neighborhood Association is asking for 2 additional permanent trash cans for there area. Can you
inspect the following locations and determine if one could be placed there? Thank you for your help in the matters.
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1.) Bohannon Ave at Homeview Ave ~ please check what corner would be best for a pad & can, if any.
2.) Racine Ave at either Bohannon Ave or 9™ Street — please check if either is acceptable and then, if so, what corner.
Thank you for all your help in this matter!

Mr. Fenster,
Would these location be available for trash removal? SWMS does remove trash at Bohannon Ave at Thornberry Ave currently.

These new requested addresses are 1 & 2 blocks away. Thank youl

Daniel Luckett, Jr.
Administrative Clerk District 15
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
office-502-574-1115
fax-502-574-4455



Luckett, Daniel R

- M oV 000

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, June 30, 2015 10:19 AM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: FW: 2 additional trash can locations

Mrs. Hughes,
Per this email and conversations with Mr. Akridge of Public Works and Steve Fenster of SWMS the following locations have
been approved for permanent trash can/concrete pad locations for the Lucky Horseshoe neighborhood.
1.) The 5.W. corner at Bohannon Ave & Homeview Ave,
2.) The S.W. corner at Bohannon Ave & Racine Ave.

From: Akridge, John L

Sent: Tuesday, June 30, 2015 10:10 AM

To: Luckett, Danfel R

Subject: RE: 2 additional trash can locations

Dan looked at the locations for you. All would need pads Bohannon & Homeview would be best at SW corner. Racine &
Bohannon would also be best at SW corner. Racine and 9™ would be best at SE corner. As far as which one on Racine would be
better, | would say the Bohannon location would be better since it is closer to the residentiat for SWMS. 9th is basically just two
parking lots directly across fram Churchill Downs gate 17.

From: Luckett, Daniel R

Sent: Tuesday, June 23, 2015 11:39 AM
To: Akridge, John L

Cc: Fenster, Steve A

Subject: 2 additional trash can locations

Hi John!
The Lucky Horseshoe Neighborhood Assaciation is asking for 2 additional permanent trash cans for there area. Can you
inspect the following locations and determine if one could be placed there? Thank you for your help in the matters.
1.) Bohannon Ave at Homeview Ave — please check what corner would be best for a pad & can, if any.
2.) Racine Ave at either Bohannon Ave or 9" Street — please check if either is acceptable and then, if so, what corner.
Thank you for all your help in this matter!

Mr. Fenster,
" Would these location be available for trash removal? SWMS does remove trash at Bohannon Ave at Thornberry Ave currently.
These new requested addresses are 1 & 2 blocks away. Thank youl

Daniel Luckett, Jr.
Administrative Clerk District 15
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
office-502-574-1115
fax-502-574-4455



'NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST
SIS

Interagency Name;

Program/Project Name:

T

i YeslN ofNA

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s} Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the

Request Form: If: matchmg funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, building
or equlpment‘? If not, the fundmg source is probably NDF.

Fundmg Source: If CIF is being requested does the project have a useful life of more than one year‘? If
not, the funding source is probably NDF.

i Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
| the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Prepared by: /&%{UZL/%{(,,« Date: VI{*’%
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