Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

Mital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
B Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butier |

| Amount: $13,000 Date: July 2, 2015 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Alley match funding for the following projects:

1. Alley running between Seelbach Ave & Stanley Ave from Peachtree Ave to
dead-end at parking lot at union hall. $16,000

2. Alley running between Craig Ave & Powell Ave from W. Southern Heights Ave
to Strader Avenue $10,000. *(1 block)* = 26K

City Agency: Public Works
Contact Person;  Andrew Metcalf
Agency Phone: 502- 574-6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax doflays, and have determined the funds

15 $13,000. July 2, 2015

District # Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount: I
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #;
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
— — —

Revised July - / - ’ﬁ | !!’ 25!



Hughes, Susan

From: Butler, Marianne <Marianne. Butler@Ige-ku.com>
Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2015 12:20 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R

Cc: Hughes, Susan

Subject: Re: Alley estimates

Let's go with them and get half paid with match
Sent from my iPad

On Jul 2, 2015, at 10:33 AM, Luckett, Daniel R <Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

1. Alley running between Seelbach Ave & Stanley Ave from Peachtree Ave to dead-end at parking
lot at union hall. $16,000

2. Alley running between Craig Ave & Powell Ave from W. Southern Heights Ave to Strader Avenue
$10,000. *(1 block)*

Daniel Luckett, Jr.
Administrative Clerk District 15
Counciilwoman Marianne Butler
office-502-574-1115
fax-502-574-4455

The information contained in this transmission is intended only for the
person or entity to which it is directly addressed or copied. It may contain material of confidential and/or private
nature. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon, this
information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is not allowed. If you received this message
and the information contained therein by error, please contact the sender and delete the material from your/any
storage medium.




Hughes, Susan

From: Butier, Marianne

Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2015 5:01 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Alley estimates

Please sign as | am out of town - thanks!

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2015 2:22 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: FW: Alley estimates

Permission for signature please.

Susan W. Hughes

Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
District 15

502-574-1115

From: Butler, Marianne [mailto:Marianne.Butler@lge-ku.com]
Sent: Thursday, July 02, 2015 12:20 PM

To: Luckett, Daniel R
Cc: Hughes, Susan
Subject: Re: Alley estimates

Let's go with them and get half paid with match
Sent from my iPad

On Jul 2, 2015, at 10:33 AM, Luckett, Daniel R
<Daniel.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov<mailto:Daniel.Luckett LOV>> wrote:

1. Alley running between Seelbach Ave & Stanley Ave from Peachtree Ave to dead-end at parking lot at union hali.

2. Alley running between Craig Ave & Powell Ave from W. Southern Heights Ave to Strader Avenue $10,000. *{1
block)*

Daniel Luckett, Jr.
Administrative Clerk District 15
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
office-502-574-1115
fax-502-574-4455




NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name: g~\V.\ A- AV - Ay )
3’2 NI W .,ﬂ@ Adlély @Wﬂh

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Mv&lber(s) Appropriating Funding?

Request Form:  If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the
request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching
fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in
the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real cstate, building
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If
not, thé funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required; Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If so, is the amount given for
the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Prepared by: %;(ﬂ/}-//

Datel_jiln & DWG
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Effective October 2013



