Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

oo™ O

I Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $2,784.00 Date: UliZ¢115

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to MPW to remove 2-Elm and 1-Ash tree in the right-of-way near the
chicken steps off Brownsboro Road near 2100 Brownsboro Road. All funding
provided by the D9 office.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works
Contact Person:  Jeffrey Brown

Agency Phone: 574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose.
9 U Il %2, 1% — 0129]15

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date'

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #;__

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



_ Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

- Program/Project Name: Tree Removal near chicken steps
Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
‘Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
- Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
 disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
. own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Réquired: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? [f
50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
- Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Effective July 2015




Ethridge, Kyle

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

Thompson, Erin

Monday, July 27, 2015 4:47 PM

Ethridge, Kyle
Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Dead/decaying trees in the ROW
Attachments: Dist 9_chick steps_deaddecling trees.PNG

Kyle-
There are 3 trees at this location that are a concern.

The first two are the dead elms. They definitely need to be removed. The third is an ash tree that is showing crown
dieback---likely EAB infestation. Based on the Bob Ray contract here are the costs that you are looking at:

# Species Diameter Cost

1 Elm 21 $768.00
2 Elm 34" $1248.00
3 Ash 21" $768.00

The ash tree is only showing around 10% dieback. If CM Hollander wants to wait on removal, | can reevaluate it next
year. Let me know. .

Thanks for your patience. W

Erin M. Thompson

Urban Farestry Coordinator

ISA Certified Arborist KY-0813A

Division of Community Forestry-Louisville Forward
527 West Jefferson Street, 6™ Floor

Louisville, KY 40202

Office: (502) 574-4030
Erin.Thompson@louisvilleky.gov

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Tuesday, July 21, 2015 3:38 PM

To: Thompson, Erin

Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Dead/decaying trees in the ROW

Erin,
I misspoke, | think there is only one we need evaluated.
Near 2100 Brownsboro Road — by the chicken steps — Sr # 4490659. See attached photo.

Thanks,
Kyle



