Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[ Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[] Paving Fund (PAV)

[ Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander, District 9

l Amount: $3,500 Date: 8/5/15

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding seurces, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Reconsider MAP allocations in the FY16 capital budget to cancel "Paving N. Bayly
from Frankfort to Hollywood Terrace" $23,500.00 from 8127 410 8105 148946
822809 and $23,500 from 8672 410 8106 048209 822702.

Add paving N. Hite from Brownsboro to Lindsay charging $27,000 to 8127 410 8105
148946 822809 and $27,000 to 8672 410 8106 048209 822702.

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets
Contact Person:  Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 502 574 6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
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Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
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Stenberg, Beth ]

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2015 5:40 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: RE: N Bayly and N Hite
Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Kyle,

The cost to repave N. Hite from Brownsboro to Lindsay is $54,000. If you need anything else, please let me know.
Thanks,
Andrew

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Friday, July 24, 2015 8:06 AM
To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: N Bayly and N Hite

Sounds good — thanks Beth

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-3908 c: (502) 333-4644

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2015 8:54 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Metcalfe, Andrew

Subject: RE: N Bayly and N Hite

Let me know when you have the estimate and what new road you want and | will work with you on the paperwork...

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2015 8:24 PM
To: Stenberg, Beth

Cc: Stenberg, Beth; Metcalfe, Andrew
Subject: Re: N Bayly and N Hite

Yes, just swap a road for the named road in the budget. I'm assuming I'll see go through approprs. Just waiting
on estimate from MPW and i'll file paperwork.

Thanks!
Ms. Kyle Ethridge

9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilman Bill Hollander



601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-1109 office
(502) 333-4644 cell

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2015 7:27 PM
To: Ethridge, Kyle

Cc: Stenberg, Beth

Subject: FW: N Bayly and N Hite

Kyle, while recording this on the MAP report, | guess | misread it once. There is nothing you want to cancel because it
cannot be done — you just wanted to swap one road for another — right?

From: Stenberg, Beth

Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2015 10:35 AM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Barr, Gerald F; Metcalfe, Andrew
Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Stenberg, Beth

Subject: RE: N Bayly and N Hite

actually it is easy. You just need to prepare a MAP request. Since the one named cannot be done, it will be
lapsed. You could go for a reconsideration, but since it was named in the ordinance, there is not a MAP
reference number and you definitely do not want to reconsider the entire ordinance.

So, when you know what street you want to do, let me know if you need help with the MAP request
form. There is no change in the already established practice for filling it out and submitting.

I will go ahead and cancel the street on the MAP report.
Thanks all,

Beth

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, July 16, 2015 8:32 AM
To: Barr, Gerald F; Metcalfe, Andrew
Cc: Hollander, Bill H.; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: RE: N Bayly and N Hite

Jerry,
Thanks so much for your review!

Andrew — could you please provide us with a cost estimate for that section of N Hite?

Thanks again,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-3908 c: (502) 333-4644




Thanks,
Andrew

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Wednesday, July 15, 2015 2:07 PM
To: Barr, Gerald F; Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: N Bayly and N Hite

Hi Jerry and Andrew,

Bill and I just drove N Bayly and N Hite between Lindsay and Brownsboro Road. We had a couple questions - N
Bayly is on the MPW paving list. How close is it to being repaved? The Councilman has reviewed the street and
would like to swap that street with N Hite which is in worse shape. How can we do that?

Also, for N Hite between Brownsboro and Lindsay there are a number of utility cuts on the road. Is this road
on a utility companies list to repave? If so, what's the timeline? Is it both sides of the street or just one?

Thank you,
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge

9th District Legislative Assistant
Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
(502) 574-1109 office

(502) 333-4644 cell



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Pyblic Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Reconsider MAP070115PWO09 and allocate new project
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

Request Form; If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will

own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes

probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Date: 8/5/15

. <
Prepared by: M &

T e S

Effective July 2015



