
CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Camp Taylor Flag Pole

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the I
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?
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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

D Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
l^j Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

Amount: $2,720.00 Date: August 5,2015

Description ofprogram/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

For the purchase and installation of a flag pole, flag and lighting to be erected in
Camp Zachary Taylor Park.

City Agency: Metro Parks

Contact Person: Jason Canuel

Agency Phone: 456-8113

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purfigs

j^ ^'.>^M^ te2^.6SD ^^^^
District # CoukG9'1$Iember Signature F Amount Date ^

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



I am so sorry that I haven't gotten back to you yet. I don't know where my notes went with your contact info. That being said here are some prices,
again I do apologize.

Qty. 1 - Sentry 30' flagpole (internal rope) $1975.00
Qty. 1 - 5x8' U.S. flag (polyester) $95.00
Qty. 1 - Installation and Materials $400.00

Thank You,
Trey

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Monday, August 03, 2015 9:59 AM
To: trev@oatesflaa.com

Good Morning,

I was hoping to get some of the prices for the flag pole we discussed at Camp Taylor Park. We would like to come to a decision by the end of the week. We
anticipate to have our event on September 20.

Thanks,

Came Peers

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Steve Magre, District 10
Louisville Metro Council
601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1110
carrie.peers@louisvilleky.gov



Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Canuel, Jason T
Tuesday, August 04, 2015 10:31 AM
Peers, Carrie G
Starch, Marty
RE:

Follow up
Flagged

We estimated the costs associated with lighting to cost $250.00.

Jason T. Canuel
Metro Parks Assistant Director
PO Box 37280
Louisville, Kentucky 40233
502.439.7694 (Cell)
502.456.8113 (Office)
jason.canuel@louisvilleky.qov

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Monday, August 03, 2015 3:04 PM
To: Storch, Marty
Cc: Canuel, Jason T
Subject: FW:

Please see the below estimates for the flag pole. In addition to this costs, what other costs do you anticipate with the lighting and mulching around it?
like to have the appropriation for this on our next meeting cycle.

would

Thanks,

Carrie

From: Trey Gates [mailto:trey@oatesflag.com]
Sent: Monday, August 03, 2015 2:29 PM
To: Peers, Carrie G
Subject: Re:

Hello Came,


