Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

[0 Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

[0 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[1 Paving Fund (PAV)

{ Primary Sponsor: Cheri Hamilton, District 5

| Amount: $18,000 Date: 8/5/15

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

$18,000 Alley paving rear 4615 - 4629 Varble

$18,000 Alley paving rear 308 Louis Coleman which runs behind the Cora Villa
Apts from Jefferson to Herman St.

Funding Sources:
$18,000 CIF to be assigned by PW&A
$18,000 Alley Match Fund (see attachment of various alley paving accounts)

City Agency:  Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Andrew Metcalfe

Agency Phone: 502 574 6789

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.
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District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:

Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



Stenberg, Beth ‘

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Wednesday, August 05, 2015 1:49 PM
To: Stenberg, Beth

Subject: FW: Alleys

Here are estimates for 2 alleys I'd like to pave. How much of the alley paving funds can | use?

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Wednesday, August 05, 2015 10:08 AM
To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: Alleys

Here are the requested estimates:
1. Alley rear 4615-4629 Varble: $18,000
2. Alley rear 308 Louis Coleman: 518,000
If you need anything else, please let me know.
Thanks,
Andrew Metcalfe

From: Hamilton, Cheri

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2015 5:18 PM
To: Metcalfe, Andrew

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: RE: Alleys

Yes Andrew. Thanks!
The alley behind the 308 block of Louis Coleman Dr. runs behind the Cora Villa Apts. from Jefferson to Herman St.

From: Metcalfe, Andrew

Sent: Tuesday, July 28, 2015 3:57 PM
To: Hamilton, Cheri

Cc: Friend-Ellis, Myra

Subject: Alleys

CW Hamilton,
| received your inner office mail containing the e-mail with two alleys listed at the bottom:
1. Alley rear 4615-4629 Varble Avenue
2. Alley rear 308 Louis Coleman Jr Dr
I wanted to confirm that you are requesting estimates to pave these two alleys? If so, | will work up the estimate and get
back with you.

Thanks,
Andrew Metcalfe



FY16 Alley Paving Match Projects CCRF
BOND - 20 yr
PAB-2014D
PAB-2009E

PAB-2004A
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Lol - 4429 Varble

1,195 8101-410-8105-148442-401101
8101-410-8105-148442-822702

2,182 8127-410-8105-148442-447001
8127-410-8105-148442-822702

775 8125-410-8105-148442-447001
8125-410-8105-148442-822702

47,873 8115-410-8105-148442-447001
8115-410-8105-148442-822702

7,975 8111-410-8105-148442-447001

8111-410-8105-148442-822702
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CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Puyblic Works & Assets

Program/Project Name: Alley pavings

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? Yes
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
probably NDF.
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? . NA
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v

€s

and description of cost?

Prepared by: M %/7%/ Date:  8/5/15
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