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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

[0 Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

O Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[ Paving Fund (PAV)

I Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler

LAmount: $3,559.90 Date: August 20, 2015 _|

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, lacation of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding used to purchase preventative material to deal with Pigeons roosting
under the overpass at Taylor Blvd. and | 264.

City Agency: Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Tim Maier

Agency Phone: 502-574-3921

d have determined the funds

I have reviewthis request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, a

will be used for a-public purpose. S/
15 $3,559.90 Aug. 20, 2015

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #;
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost; Funds Returned:
—— = —_—

Revised July 2015



Luckett, Daniel R
m

From: Maier, Tim

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 2:59 PM

To: Butler; Marianne; Butler, Denny (State Rep.) (LRC); Wright, Tom; Luckett, Daniel R
Ce: Brown, Jeffrey E; Bradiey, Maxwell B.

Subject: RE: Pigeon spikes

Attachments: 0037560653 .pdf

Looks like we will save almost $1000.00 with Grainger. The material can be received with ion 1 or two days of the order and PO#.

Please appropriate $3559.90, | have copied Max Bradley in to be advise when funds are available also. Thank you

Tim Maier

District Operations Administrator
Public Works & Assets

444 8. 5th Street Suite 400
Leouisville, KY. 40202
{502)574-3921

b

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 2:43 PM

To: Maier, Tim; Butler, Denny (State Rep.) (LRC); Wright, Tom; Luckett, Daniel R
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: RE: Pigeon spikes

Thanks Tim -- T would love to have them installed before it gets cold and the adhesive won't work as well.

Marianne
Louisville Metro Council
District 15

From: Maier, Tim

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 1:58 PM

To: Butler, Denny (State Rep.) (LRC); Butler, Marianne; Wright, Tom; Luckett, Daniei R
Cc: Brown, Jeffrey E

Subject: FW: Pigeon spikes

Since we do not have a contract with this vendor | will need to take another direction that may even save a few dollars. In order
for me to purchase these we will need to go through our Grainger contract. | will get with our Representative and obtain the
quote for these materials and follow back up. Thanks

Tim Maier

District Operations Administrator
Public Works & Assets

444 8. 5th Street Suite 400
Louisville, KY. 40202
(502)574-3921



From: Bradley, Maxwell B,

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 10:26 AM
To: Maier, Tim

Subject: RE: Pigeon spikes

That's not a Metro contract #. | would need to see a hard copy to get with Paul R.
To obtain this product without a contract you would need 3 quote method since total appears to be over $2500.
That said, 8” bird spikes are already available from our Grainger contract at what appears to be equal per foot pricing {not to

mention we get a yearly rebate from Grainger):
http://www grainger.com/search?nls=1&nlsit=0.8&ssf=2&searchQuery=bird+spikes

From: Maier, Tim

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 10:15 AM
To: Bradley, Maxwell B.

Subject: FW: Pigeon spikes

Is this a contract we can use?

Tim Maier

District Operations Administrator
Public Works & Assets

444 S. 5th Street Suite 400
Louisville, KY. 40202
(502)574-3921

N

\\: fa/’

From: Andrew James [mailto:andrew.james@prestox.com]

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 10:14 AM
To: Maier, Tim
Subject: Re: Pigeon spikes

Vendor Contract Number V50000040587
FEIN # 231568350

It will be under our Parent Company of J C Ehrlich
for State Park, Hazelwood Hopsital

On Wed, Aug 19, 2015 at 10:05 AM, Maier, Tim <Tim.Maier@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
Thank you James, do you have the contract number we discussed?

Tim Maier
District Operations Adntinistrator



GRAINGER.

Customer Quotation

1IN
To: Information
Date 08/19/2015
LOUISVILLE PUB WORKS-PUBL PROPS Custormer Account Number 805783818
444 S 5TH ST Grainger Quote Number 37560653
LOUISVILLE KY 40202-2332 Customer Job Number
Grainger Represantalive Eric Todd
Phone Number
Fax Number
Email
Grainger Tax ID 36-1150280
ltem  Description Cat. $ Qty $ Ext. Start Exp.
Manufacturer Name & Model Pg.# Each ¢ Quote Price Date Date
20YR32 Bird Repellent Spikes, 100 fi. 1439 503.50 8 395.88 3,167.04 08/19/2015 08/18/2015
BIRD BARRIER BP-F3100
Country of Origin: USA
6CJNS8  Heavy Duty Adhesive for Bird 1439 20.69 26 15.11 392.86 08/19/2015 09718/2015
Spikes
BIRD-X SSA-G
Country of Origin: USA
Total § 3,559.90

Grainger.com

All orders are subject to the terms and conditions in your current contract with Grainger or to Grainger's current Terms of Sala as set forth on

Thank You!
Visft us at grainger.com
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CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Pyblic Works

Program/Project Name: Pigeon Spikes

:_ o ”Yes/ No/NA
Reqtiest Form: Is the Request Signed Ey all Council Member(s)

~ Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used,aretheydlsclosed with
account humbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the |
request exclude the matching fund amount? . NA

Réquest Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

| disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is No
probably NDF. :

' Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful |

- life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than |
$5,0007? If so, an ordinance is required. No

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

- 50, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supportmg Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

- and description of cost? | Yes
Prepared by: shughes Date: August 20,2015

——————————————SS— BB —=—_——_EEBBe——SIS_ieh—————————._“—_——_—_—_——~—~—————————————_uuaaea)
Effective July 2015




Hughes, Susan

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2015 3:21 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Signature for Pigeons CIF

susan -- please sign for the wire purchase to help with the pigeon problem at the underpass on Taylor.
Thanks - Marianne

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2015 3:07 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: Signature for Pigeons CIF

THANKS

Susan W. Hughes
Legislative Assistant to
Councilwoman Marianne Butler
District 15

502-574-1115



