Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
[0 Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
[1 Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAY)
O

| Primary Sponsor: Marianne Butler

| Amount; $261.51 Date: August 24, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Legal Ad required for public hearing for Jacobs Neighborhood Plan published in
the Courier Journal.

City Agency:  Planning and Design
Contact Person;  Brian Davis

Agency Phone: 574-5160

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public purpose.

15 $261.51 8/24/15
District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: B Amended Amount:
Reference #; To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned: B
—— — — —_—

Revised July 2015




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Planning and Design/Louisville Foward
' Program/Project Name: CJ Ad Jacob's plan

‘ Yes/No/NA |
. Request Form: |s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes
én“Request Form: Wlfwr'ﬁ'étching funds are to be used, aré“fﬁev disclosed with NA

~ account numbers in the request form description?

e B e e
| request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Reciuést Form: If other funds are to be used for this préjééf, are the{;
. disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Fundmg Source: If CIF is b'é"i'ng requested,maaé; Metro Louisville own/wrll
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is NA
probably NDF.

FundmgSource If CIFls being requé&éa, does the prOJecthave a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. NA

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than A
£ $5,0007 If so, an ordinance is required. No

- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? i No
6H‘i|—i§bocumé"r;tﬂént'ion: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
 and description of cost? . Yes

Prepared by: shughes Date: August24.2015

,
Effective July 2015



Hughes, Susan

From: Baker, Kendal

Sent: Friday, August 21, 2015 3:21 PM

To: Hughes, Susan; Butler, Marianne

Cc: Milliken, Gretchen P; King, Michael M; Tom Stephens
(toms@centerforneighborhoods.org); Davis, Brian; Liu, Emily

Subject: Legal Ad for Jacobs Neighborhood Plan public hearing

Attachments; OrderConf.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

CW Butler/Susan:

The legal ad for public hearing for Jacobs Neighborhood Plan should have run today (for Public Hearing on Sept. 3).
Attached is receipt from C-J. This was paid for through Planning and Design; thanks to Brian Davis with PDS for all his
help in getting this done quickly.

Reimbursement should go to Planning and Design for $261.51.

Thanks,
Ken

Kendal R, Baker, AICP

Planning Manager, Advanced Planning
Develop Louisville

LOUISVILLE FORWARD

Metro Development Center

444 S Fifth Street, Suite 600
Louisville, KY 40202-4313
502-574-5822

Email: kendal.baker@louisvilleky.gov

www.louisvilleky.gov/developlouisville

From: Davis, Brian

Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 10:30 AM
To: King, Michael M; Baker, Kendal

Subject: FW: legal notice

----- Original Message-—----

From: LCJ-Janice LCJ-Richardson [mailto:jrichardson2@gannett.com]

1



Sent: Wednesday, August 19, 2015 10:24 AM
To: Davis, Brian
Subject: legal notice

legal notice for 8/21, the cost is $261.51, thank you, Janice



Order Confirmation for Ad #: 0000668181

Customer: LOUISVILLE METRO PLANNING C
Address: 444 S 5TH ST STE 300
LOUISVILLE KY 402024313 USA
Acct. #: LCJ-618150
Phone: 5025746230
Payor: LOUISVILLE METRO PLANNING C
Ordered By; Brian Davis

OrderStart Date: 08/21/2015 Order End Date: 08/27/2015
Jear Sheets Blind Box  Promo Type Materials
0
Net Amount Jax Amount Total Amount PaymentMethod Payment Amount Amount Due
$261.51 $0.00 $261.51 Credit Card $0.00 $261.51
Ad Order Notes:_
Sales Rep: jrichardson2 Order Taker: jrichardson2
Product #lns Start Date End Date

LCJ-CJ.com . 7 08/21/2015 08/27/2015
LCJ-Courier Journal 1 08/21/2015 0872172015



Text of Ad:

PUBLIC HEARING

Louisville Metro Planning
Commission
Thursday, September 3, 2015,
1:00 pm, Cld Jail Building, 514
W. Liberty St.
Case No. 15NEIGHPLAN1000,
Jacobs Neighborhood Plan. Said
case may be inspected in the of-
fice of Metro Planning and De-
sign, 444 S 5th St, Suite 300,
Louisville, Kentucky. For special
accommodations or additional
information contact Planning at
574-6230 or www.louisvilleky.g
ov/planningdesign. TDD 1-800-
648-6056.




Huahes, Susan

From: Butler, Marianne

Sent: Monday, August 24, 2015 2:58 PM
To: Hughes, Susan

Subject: RE: Emailing: Jacob Plan CJ

Susan -- please sign - thanks Marianne

From: Hughes, Susan

Sent: Monday, August 24, 2015 1:11 PM
To: Butler, Marianne

Subject: Emailing: Jacob Plan CJ

Marianne, please approve for sighature. thanks

Your message is ready to be sent with the following file or link attachments:

Jacob Plan CJ

Note: To protect against computer viruses, e-mail programs may prevent sending or receiving certain types of file
attachments. Check your e-mail security settings to determine how attachments are handled.



