
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

El Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

D Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

Amount: $1,630.00 Date: Sept. 4,2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

For the license, annual service maintenance agreement and 12 months of Time
Warner Cable service for the operation of a LMPD camera in the right of way at
3317BardstownRd.

City Agency: LMPD

Contact Person: AmV McTyeire

Agency Phone: 574-7421

I have reviewed this r^guest for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a pul^ic purpose/

10
rrvo7/
rp.ill/(/7^/ /c^ $1'630-00

District # -^Council Member Si^itur^ Amount

Sept. 4,2015

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: LMPD

Program/Project Name: Crime Camera Support

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

NA

NA

No

NA

Yes

Prepared by:, Date: Sept. 4,2015

Effective July 2 015



Franklin Gray, Lisa A.

From:

Sent:

To:
Subject:
Attachments:

Peers, Carrie G

Friday, September 04, 2015 10:45 AM
Franklin Gray, Lisa A.
FW: Cameras

LMPDCameraCIF09042015.pdf;LMPDCameraNDF09042015.pdf

Would you mind to print the attachments and this e-mail? This printer is not functioning at the moment.

Thanks,

Carrie

From: Yates, Terri L
Sent: Tuesday, September 01, 2015 10:48 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G; Seidt, Chris
Subject: RE: Cameras

My understanding is that LMPD will be paying this invoice to TWC monthly not Technology.

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Monday, August 31, 2015 11:15 AM
To: Seidt, Chris
Cc: Yates, Terri L
Subject: RE: Cameras

Good Morning,

Just checking in to see if anything was worked out on the TWC service Councilman Magre needs for a LMPD camera for

Thanks,

Carrie Peers

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Steve Magre, District 10
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1110
carrie.peers@)louisvillekv.eov

--Original Message--
From: Seidt, Chris

Sent: Friday, August 14, 2015 8:38 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G

Cc: Yates, Terri L

Subject: RE: Cameras



We could possibly setup handling the TWC portion. I've copied Terri Yates to see what would be needed.

--Original Message--
From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Friday, August 14,2015 8:34 AM
To: Seidt, Chris

Subject: RE: Cameras

Amy Mclntyre with LMPD said they are not equipped to handle the twc billing.

From: Seidt, Chris

Sent: Friday, August 14, 2015 8:25 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G

Subject: RE: Cameras

Carrie,

I believe LMPD would act as the fiscal agent for this particular project.

Thanks,
Chris

From: Peers, Carrie G

Sent: Thursday, August 13, 2015 11:29 AM
To: Seidt, Chris

Subject: FW: Cameras

Chris,

A few weeks ago we spoke about Councilman Magre installing an LMPD camera in District 10. Below is a cost
b^akdowno_fthecameraandone years-worth °fTWC service for it's operation. Will Technology act as"a7iscal agent
and accept an appropriation of these funds for the camera and service costs. If so, we anticipate' onhaving'this^em^

and heard in the next meeting cycle.

Sincerely,

[http://mymetro.lou/sites/mymetro.lou/files/shared%20files/metro°/o201ogos/lou_metro_logo50px.gif]
Carrie Peers

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Steve Magre, District 10
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202
(502)574-1110

carrie.peers@louisvilieky.gov<mailto:ca rrie.peers@louisvilleky.gov>

From: McTyeire, Amy
Sent: Wednesday, August 12, 2015 5:43 PM
To: Peers, Carrie G



Cc: Lincoln, Brandon

Subject: Cameras

Carrie,

Updated first year camera expenses are broken out below.

Cameras Expense:
Camera

Components
Mount

Ix license

Annual SMA

$3,400
799
100
2S5~~\
55 \

TWC $110*12 $1,320--^
TOTAL $5,929

Amy McTyeire
Executive Administrator

Louisville Metro Police Department
(502) 574-7421




