Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

|:| Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[1 paving Fund (PAV)

[ Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $2,054.40 Date: September 3, 2014

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to MPW for a curb cut in the alley next to 116 Franck Avenue. All funding
provided by D9 office.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works
Contact Person: Craig Allen

Agency Phone: 574-6159

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose.
9 %*VU( M/\ $2,054.40 Seplembar 3, 2015

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



_ CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Curb Cut - alley near 116 Franck Ave

Request Form: Is the Reque‘st Signed by all Council Membér'(S)
Appropriating Funding?

Yes/No/NA

probably NDF.

Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 orless? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v

es

and description of cost?

Prepared by:

Date: /4- / 15

Effective July 2015




Ethridge, Kyle

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Kyle,

Allen, Craig L

Wednesday, August 26, 2015 12:39 PM
Ethridge, Kyle

Hollander, Bill H.; Rivers, Arnitra N

RE: Curb Cut Estimate SR # 4420013

Follow up
Flagged

Here are two options for the curb cuts on Franck Ave. The first estimate is for the curb cut at the alley next to 116
Franck Ave. The second is for the two alleys and Payne St curb cuts on Franck Ave. Both estimates only cover the curb
cuts on the west side of Franck, not the other side of the road.

Metro’s ADA Plan, which has yet to be formally adopted, says that we will change the city’s curb cuts into ramps as we
pave the roads. The ADA Plan will potentially be formally adopted at the end of the year.

If you have any other questions please let me know

SR# 4420013

LOCATION Alley Next to 116 Franck Ave
REQUESTED BY Dist 9

RATE N/A, Curb Cut

DATE SENT 8/26/2015

ESTIMATE BY CA

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS

12" of curb, 12'x4' of si Ik, 8 sfof
detectable warnaings, seed and

ESTIMATE AMOUNT

/s2,05440 )/

Any reqifests a days will

sent.
require re-inspec

SR# 4420013

Alley next to 116 Franck Ave, alley next to

226 Franck Ave, and Curb Cuts on either

LOCATION side of Payne St
REQUESTED BY Dist 9
RATE N/A, Curb Cut
DATE SENT 8/26/2015
ESTIMATE BY CA

MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS

41 SY of sw, 49' of curb, 32 SF of
detectable warnings, 1 utility cover, 13
SY of concrete removal, fill, seed and
protection.

S



ESTIMATE AMOUNT l $11,188.97

Estimate is valid for 90 days from date
sent. Any requests after 90 days will
require re-inspection.

Thanks,

rvaig #ltles

Engineer I

Louisville Metro Government
Department of Public Works
444 South 5 Street, Suite 400
Louisville, KY 40202

Otfice: (502) 574-6159

Fax. (502) 574-4129

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2015 3:14 PM

To: Allen, Craig L

Cc: Hollander, Bill H.

Subject: RE: Curb Cut Estimate SR # 4420013

Hi Craig,

Just wanted to follow-up regarding cost estimate for 120 Franck.

Thanks!
Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legisiative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
p: (502) 574-3908 c: (502) 333-4644

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2015 2:43 PM

To: Allen, Craig L

Subject: RE: Curb Cut Estimate SR # 4420013

Hi Craig,

I’'m just going through old emails. Did you send the cost estimate for Franck?

Thanks!

Kyle

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant




