
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

D Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
|^j Capital Infrastructure Fund (GIF)

D Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
D Paving Fund (PA V)

Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

Amount: $430.00 Date: September 22, 2015

Description ofprogram/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

For the fabrication and installation of two signs by Public Works located in the
right of way at Swan & Oaks Sts. at the "Rain Garden" for $252.00 and at the
access path at Schuff Ln. that leads to the Zoo For $178.

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Jeff Brown

Agency Phone: 574-0065

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a publjje^ippos^

10

District # Council Member. §tfgna^e

$430.00

Amount

22 Sept. 2015

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:
Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: public Works

Program/Project Name: Sign Fabrication and Installation
Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? I Yes

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? I NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA

Funding Source: If GIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is | yes
probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. I NA

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost? Yes

Prepared Date: September 22, 2

Effective July 2015



Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Brown, Jeffrey E
Tuesday, September 15, 2015 10:14 AM
Peers, Carrie G
RE: FW: Jim King rain garden

The sign shop can fabricate and install an Honorary Street Name sign for $178

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Monday, September 14, 2015 2:35 PM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RE: FW: Jim King rain garden

He said those dimensions are fine with him.

Did he also speak to you about another sign along the walking path off of Schuff Ln. He's also like to install a sign there, where the star is on the below
map. This walking path goes from there all the way to the back of the Zoo. Apparently, police have had to be called back there and without some type of official
name, it was hard for them to find it. This sign can be much smaller. How much would a sign like this run. I can just do one appropriation for both of them.

Thanks,

Carrie
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To: Peers, Carrie G
Subject: RE: R/V: Jim King rain garden

It's $252 for the 60" x 30", which is a BIG sign. Do you want to consider something smaller?

Jeffrey Brown, PE, PTOE

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Tuesday, September 08, 2015 11:15 AM
To: Brown, Jeffrey E
Subject: RA/: RA/: Jim King rain garden

Good Morning,

Councilman Magre would like to get a price for the sign to go at the rain garden you and he discussed.

Thanks,

Carrie

From: Steve Magre [mailto:stevemaare.m39(a)gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 03, 2015 8:09 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G
Subject: Fwd: R/V: Jim King rain garden

Call Jeff to get a price. I love it. I think the sign should go on the north side facing traffic that
comes south from the intersection of Swan at E. Oak on to Swan.

Forwarded message
From: Magre, Steve <Steve.Magre(%louisvilleky.gov>
Date: Thu, Sep 3, 2015 at 8:01 AM
Subject: FW: Jim King rain garden
To: "Stevemaere.m39®,gmail.com" <Stevemagre.m39fa),gmail.com>

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Wednesday, September 02, 2015 6:20 PM
To: Magre, Steve
Subject: Fwd: Jim King rain garden



The sign shop came up with a nice design. Let us know what you think

Sent from my Verizon Wireless 4G LTE smartphone

Original message
From: "Hall, Barbara C" <Barbara.Hall(%louisvilleky.gov>
Date: 09/02/2015 6:16 PM (GMT-05:00)
To: "Brown, Jeffrey E" <Jeffrev.Brown(%louisvillekv.gov>
Cc: "Graves, Derek" <Derek.Graves(%louisvillekv.gov>. "Sparks, Stuart" <Stuart.Sparks(%louisvilleky.gov>. "Slaughter, Kenneth G.'
<Kenneth. Slaughter(%louisvilleky. gov>
Subject: RE: Jim King rain garden

Jeff,

We've helped Parks out with their park entrance signage and this is the format we used to mimic their contoured wood signs:

s^^s^^^^'



It's quite large (60x30"), but could easily be scaled down.

Happy Wednesday!

BC (Barbara) Hall, Sign Tech

Louisville Metro Public Works

Division of Signs & Markings

1450LexingtonRd

Louisville, KY 40206

(502) 574-3251

Flfr'lKEMIVI ()1

IJURLIC WORKS

From: Brown, Jeffrey E
Sent: Wednesday, September 02, 2015 8:21 AM
To: Sparks, Stuart
Cc: Hall, Barbara C; Graves, Derek
Subject: Jim King rain garden



Stuart,

CM Magre would like to allocate funds for Signs & Markings to fabricate and install a memorial sign at the Swan & Ellison rain garden. Can you have Barb work
up some graphic options for a sign with just "Jim King Rain Garden" and maybe a fleur de lis on an aluminum blank?

One option he liked was the Gnadinger Park sign located at Ellison & Reutlinger
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CM Magre would like to allocate funds for Signs & Markings to fabricate and install a memorial sign at the Swan & Ellison rain garden. Can you have Barb work
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Original message
From: "Peers, Carrie G" <Carrie.Peers(%louisvilleky.gov>
Date: 09/01/2015 2:13 PM (GMT-05:00)
To: "Brown, Jeffrey E" <Jeffrev.Brown(%louisvilleky.gov>
Subject:

Jeff,

Councilman Magre would like for you to call him, 855-0223, please. He would like to discuss the rain garden (pictured below) located in the right
of way at Swan and Oak Streets and installing a sign there renaming it after the late Council President Jim King.

Thanks,

Carrie
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Came Peers

Legislative Assistant

Councilman Steve Magre, District 10

Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

(502)574-1110

came.peers(%louisvillekv. gov

Steve Magre
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