Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fun‘d {(NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)

OO0

] Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

| Amount: $2,372.50 Date: September 14, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

To Metro Parks for the installation of a sign in Camp Taylor Park regarding the
history of the Naturalization Monument located in the park.

City Agency: Metro Park
Contact Person: Marty Stoch

Agency Phone: 456-8176

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a publicpurpose. .
M“ $2,372.50 Sept. 14, 2015

District # Céuncil Memt(er Siyéture Amount Date
et
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



Interagency Name:  Metro Parks

Program/Project Name: Camp Taylor Monument Sign

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: if matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

'Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the réquest a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Yés/ No/ NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate

- and description of cost?

Effective July 2015

Yes

. Date:  sepemberis 2015




Peers, Carrie G

From: Shawna Cherrie <shawna@nimlok-kentucky.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 01, 2015 11:32 AM

To: Peers, Carrie G

Subject: Re: Naturalization Tree Monument

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Carrie,

Here is the estimate to produce this style sign with the graphic.

Post & Panel angled sign

Face: 36 x 24 x 3” Deep

Posts: 2 ea 90.0000” x 2 1/4” x 3” Rectangular Post
Post Caps: Standard Post Cap 2 1.4” x 3”

Double Post Mount

Non [luminated

Will match Pantone Color for Posts and Face

Will Need High Resolution Artwork
Will Need PMS Color for frame

$2,372.50
Includes, Design layout, Production and Installation

Thank you,

ShawnaCherrie
sales | design

Nimlok Kentucky | Sign Craflers
exhibits - environments « graphics * signs

p: 502.499.7566
i 502.553.4158

cheok us out oniing:



Peers, Carrie G

From: Storch, Marty

Sent: Monday, October 12, 2015 11:54 AM
To: Peers, Carrie G

Cc: Babb, Jade R.

Subject: RE:

Yes we will accept these funds.

From: Peers, Carrie G

Sent: Monday, October 12, 2015 11:48 AM
To: Storch, Marty

Cc: Babb, Jade R.

Subject:

Good Morning,

Will Parks accept the funds for the installation of a sign to be installed next to the Naturalization Monument? The artwork for this sign is attached. There was a
mockup of the sign at the event in September.

Thanks,

Carrie Peers

Legislative Assistant

Councilman Steve Magre, District 10
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street

Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1110
carrie.peers@louisvilleky.gov




