
Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)

l^j Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

D Paving Fund (PAV)

Primary Sponsor: Steve Magre

Amount: $500.00 Date: October 15, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

To Public Works for the installation of a bike rack in the right of way at 1101 Lydia
St.

City Agency: Public Works

Contact Person: Dirk Gowin

Agency Phone: 574-5925

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds
will be used for a public piy^iQse.

10

District # Council Member Sig^atu^

$500.00

Amount

October 15. 2015

Date

Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & 0MB Use Only:

Request Amount:

Reference #:

Amended Amount:

To 0MB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Actual Cost:

Completion Date:

Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015



CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAY INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: public Works

Program/Project Name: Bike Rack on Lyida St.

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the
request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will
own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is
probably NDF. I

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful |
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If
so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate
and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

NA

Yes

Prepared by: Date: October 15,2015

Effective July 2015



Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:
Attachments:

Follow Up Flag:
Flag Status:

Gowin, Dirk L
Wednesday, September 09, 2015 10:59 AM
Peers, Carrie G
Eisinger, John (Rolf)
RE: Bike Rack
public works quote.pdf

Follow up
Completed

Carrie,

The cost of the rack is still $500 and we can do the installation to save you all some cost. Public Works will accept the funding.

Vh&^. ^oww. ps. p^s. pios
502.57^.5</Z5

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Wednesday, August 26, 2015 2:55 PM
To: Gowin, Dirk L
Subject: Bike Rack

Dirk,

Councilman Magre would like to appropriate funds for a bike rack (the simple loop style) installed in the right of way at 1343 Hickory St. like the one Pres. King
did last year. The cost of that one was $500. Can you advise of the current cost and if Public Works would accept the funds for this project?

Thanks,

Carrie



Peers, Carrie G

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Gowin, Dirk L
Monday, October 12, 2015 5:29 PM
Peers, Carrie G
Bradley, Maxwell B.
RE:

Yes, we will accept.

Vii&A. ^uwt. PS. P^S. P70S
502.574.5^25

From: Peers, Carrie G
Sent: Wednesday, September 30, 2015 1:00 PM
To: Gowin, Dirk L
Subject:

Good Afternoon,

Councilman Magre would like to fund a bike rack, the silver single loop style, in the right of way at 1101 Lydia. Will Public Works accept the funds for this
project?

Thanks,


