Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
L] , Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
[J Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Primary Sponsor: Councilman David James

Amount: $960.00 Date: December | 72015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Installation for 2 benches at the cost of $960.00

The Benches will be installed on 6™ Street in the Limerick Neighborhood

City Agency: Metro Public Works & Assets
Contact Person: Andrew Metcalife

Agency Phone: 574-6789

| have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the
funds will be used for a publi

(0 TG00%= 1122301

District # Councilymger Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: ' Funds Returned:

Revised July 2013




NDF OR CIF INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

. Interagency Name: Public Works

- Program/Project Name: Limerick Neighborhood Benches

Yes/No/NA

Request Form: Is the NDF Request Signed by all Council Member(s) Appropriating Funding? yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with account numbers in the o
request form description?

- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the request exclude the matching o

- fund amount?
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they disclosed with account numbers in o/
the request form description? v
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will own the real estate, bu11d1ng .
or equipment? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. yes
Fundmg Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful life of more than one year? If es
not, the funding source is probably NDF, y
Ordinance Required: Isthe NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than $5,0007? no
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If 80, is the amount given for o

 the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Prepared by: (f I (Ulies Date: /2 -/ /5

e ]

Effective October 2013




Smith, Wanda M

From: Taghizadeh, Mojgan

Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2015 6:30 PM
To: Smith, Wanda M

Cc: James, David A

Subject: RE: Benches

Public Works will accept funds  for benches in District 6 ( $960.00). Please let me know if you have any questions.
Thanks

Phose: 302 574 3873

Mojgan Taghizadeh

From: Smith, Wanda M

Sent: Tuesday, December 22, 2015 1:26 PM
To: Taghizadeh, Mojgan

Cc: James, David A

Subject: Benches

Importance: High

Would you be willing to accept and process the $960.00 that is being alappropriated for benches in District 67 Please
advise. Thank you.

Wanda Mitchell-Smith
Legislative Assistant

District 6

David A. James, Councilman
Louisville Metro Council

601 W. Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

(502) 574-1106
Wanda.smith@louisvilleky.gov

This message contains information which may be confidential and privileged.
Unless you are the intended recipient (or authorized to receive this message
for the intended recipient), you may not use, copy, disseminate or disclose to
anyone the message or any information contained in the message. If you have
received the message in error, please advise the sender by reply e-mail, and
delete the message. Thank you very much.




