Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request

O / Neighberhood Development Fund (NDF)
E Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)

O Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

[] Paving Fund (PAV)

] Primary Sponsor: Bill Hollander

| Amount: $1,169.00 Date: December 23, 2015

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources, location of
project/program and any external grantee(s):

Grant to MPW for pavement markings and new signage at Zorn & Mellwood
intersection to address traffic concerns. MPW will provide the other half of the

funding.

City Agency:  Metro Public Works
Contact Person:  Stuart Sparks

Agency Phone: 574-3650

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds

will be used for a public purpose
9 % @?’W $1,169 12/28/15

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date

Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: To OMB;:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

Revised July 2015




Ethridge, Kyle

From: Sparks, Stuart

Sent: Tuesday, December 15, 2015 2:36 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Shelley, Michael B; Hollander, Bill H.

Cc: Johnson, Pat W

Subject: RE: Traffic Signal Status - Zorn and Mellwood - Sr # 4462385
Attachments: Zorn @ Mellwood_striping improvements.docx

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Kyle and CM Hollander,

Louisville Metro Public Works has reviewed the above listed intersection and determiined making tmprovements
associated with pavement markings and signage will be the best solution tgdddress concerns associgted with this
intersection. Attached is our proposal. As designed, this project is estimated to cost $2,338. Addifionally, if deemed
necessary after a review of this location approximately one year after this ation, we would like to
consider installing 12 delineator posts at an additional cost of $1,752.00 (for a project total of $4,090). We think this
project would positively impact safety at this iocation, however, it will be difficult to manage based on current budgetary
constraints. Would Council be willing to partner with LMPW for this project? Please let me know how you would like to
proceed, if you have any questions or if you would like to discuss this matter further.

Kindly,

Stuart Sparks, PE, PTOE

Louisville Metro Public Works

Traffic Engineering Supervisor Signs and Markings
601 W Jefferson St, Room 8

(502) 574-3650

From: Ethridge, Kyle

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2015 8:30 AM

To: Shelley, Michael B; Hollander, Bill H.

Cc: Johnson, Pat W; Sparks, Stuart

Subject: RE: Traffic Signal Status - Zorn and Mellwood - Sr # 4462385

Thank you!

Ms. Kyle Ethridge | Legislative Assistant
Office of Councilman Bill Hollander

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
d: (502) 574-3908 o: (502) 574-1109

From: Shelley, Michael B

Sent: Wednesday, December 09, 2015 12:23 PM

To: Ethridge, Kyle; Hollander, Bill H.

Cc: Johnson, Pat W; Sparks, Stuart

Subject: RE: Traffic Signal Status - Zorn and Mellwood - Sr # 4462385




CIF, NDF, MAP OR PAV INTERAGENCY CHECKLIST

Interagency Name: Metro Public Works

Program/Project Name: Pavement and signage for Mellwood and Zorn
Yes/No/NA

kRVequést Form: Is the Request Signéd by all Council Member(s)

Appropriating Funding? Yes

'Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with

account numbers in the request form description? NA

Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of the

request exclude the matching fund amount? NA

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? Yes

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville own/will

own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the funding source is Yes

probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. Yes

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA

Ordinance Required: [s the request a transfer from NDF to cost center? If

so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid estimate v
es

and description of cost?

Prepared by: ; J% %% Date: ovecorbe 23 2015




